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the chair.

Senator Helen Hery Senator Joa Neal

Senator Archie Pozzi Senator Richard Blakemocre
Senator Warren onrce Serator William Raggio
Senator Carl Dodge

HT VWERED:

James Lambert, Chief - Nevada Hichway Patrol
Leonard Winkelman, Internal Auditor, Department of Motor Vehicle:
Ernest Newton, Nevada Taxpaver's ASbOClaLlOn

TEEN TAKEN ON THE FOLLOWING MEASURES:

After a short discussion on this bill by the committee wherein
it was decided it was an emergency measure,

Senator Blakemore moved "Do Pass
Seconded by SBanator NMeal

ilotion Carried

Senator Herr said that she would try toc get in on
this morning.

Attachment #2) T
gale) tnlS Hill sshich wou

See

{See Zttachement #3)

Senator Blakemore moved "We concur with Assembly Amendment.
Seconded by Senator Pozzi
lotion Carried.

After a short discussion with remarks explaining purpcose of the
bill by James Lambert,
Senator Blakemore moved "Do Pass.’
Seconded by Senator Neal

Motion Carried

Senator Pozzi reqguested that we hold this bill for full committee

The committee agreed.
Leonard Winkelman testifisd as to the purpose of this bill.

Senator Neal moved "Do Pass”
geconcded by Senator Blakemore.
Motion Carried.
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.’AB 220%  After a short discussion by the committee,
Senator Pozzi moved “Do Pass.’

Saeconded by Seha ror Blakemore.
Motion Carried.

AB 043% James Lambert testified as to the purpose of this bill.
Senator Pozzi moved "Do Pass."
Seconded by Senator HNeal.
Motion Carried. -

The neeting was then adjourned.

xesbectrullv sugmltted

APPROVED BY:
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Amendments 1o XEESEEELEK / Ssnate

Bill /OSSR EEEKEA No. 431 (BDR_22-1740)

Proposed by_Assemblyvman Dini

Amendment N9 5543 "Desolvaes conflict with AB 652."

Amend the bill as a whole by deleting sec. & and renumbering sactions

7 and 8 as sections 6 and 7.




ATTACHMENT #3
ASSEMBLY / SENAGE: AMENDMENT BLANK

'l Amendments to xissesmbly / Senate
Bill /:cintxResedusdon No._ 564 (BDR43-1819 )

Proposed by ! 10

Amendment }%? 5415

Amend section 1, page 1, by deleting lines 24 and 25, on page 2, by deleting

-

lines 1 through 3 and inserting:

o{2) The division of brand inspection of the state department of

agriculture;

{3) The attorney general;

. (4) Duly appointed city or county juvenile cofficers;

(5 District attorney offices;

{6) Sheriff offices; and

{(7) Police departments in the state,”.
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(REPRINTED WITH ADOPTED AMENDMENTS e
' FIRST REPRINT : S-B-226

SENATE BILL NO. 226 SENATOR POZZI
FEBRUARY 13, 1973 i

....__.._.o—_.__...
Referred to Comnnttee on Transportation

SUMMARY—-EnmIes senior cmzens ‘'without drivers’ hccnm to receive
official identification cards. Fxscal Note: No. (BDR 38-517)

' '@’

EXPLANATION~—Matter in talics i3 new; matter in brackets [1 is
1 . material to be omitted.

AN ACT entitling every citizen without a driver’s license to obtain an identification

eard; providing for preparation and issuance of the cards by the department of
motor vehicles; providing fees for such cards; provndmg penalties; and provid-
ing other matters properly relatmg thereto.

- The People of the State of Nevada, represented in. Senate and Assembly,

09 DO DO D3 DO DO bud ok pond ok ok ok ok ek ok i ; 7 :
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do enact as follows

SECTION 1 Chapter 427A of NRS is "hereby. amended by addmg
thereto the provisions set forth as séctions 2 to 11, inclusive, of this act.

SEC. 2. The legislature finds and declares that: ~

1. A need exists in this state for the creation of a system of zdentzﬁca—

tion for citizens who do not hold a driver's license.

2.. These citizens should be provided a convenient means to identify
themselves so that they may take full advantage of various public and
private Services, przvzleges discounts and other beneﬁts for which appro—
priate identification is required.

3. To serve this purpose, official identification cards should be pre-

pared for issuance to those citizens who wish to apply for them. The cards
should be designed in such form, and distributed pursuant to such con-
trols, that they will merit the general acceptab:hty of dnvers licenses for

personal identification.

SEc. 3. As used in this act: '

1. “Citizen” means a person over 60 years of age who is a reszdent of
this state at the time he applies for an ldentzﬁcanon card.

2. “Identification card” means a card issued in accordance wuh this
act to provide citizens a convenient means of personal identification.

SEC. 4. 1. Every citizen who does not hold a Nevada driver’s license
- and makes an application as provzded in this act is entitled to receive an

identification card.

2. The department of motor vehzcles shall charge and collecl the

same fees for issuance of an original, duphcate or changed identification
card as for a driver’s lzcense ,

- Original bill is_ 3 pages long.
Contact the Research Library for
a copy of the complete bill.
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 (REPRINTED WITH ADOPTED AMENDMENTS) |
SECOND REPRINT S. B. 481

SENATE BILL NO. 481—SENATORS YOUNG SWOBE,
- WILSON AND RAGGIO

" MaArcH 15, 1973 -
' Referred to Committee on Federal, State and Local Governments

SUMMARY——Redcﬁnw contents of master plan and zoning regulauons
Fiscal Note: No (BDR 22-1740)

@

Exm.zmnon—Mmer in itallcs is new; matter in brackets [ } ia
material to be ommc

- AN ACT reiating to the regulatioh of land use; redefining master plans; redefining

~ .the content of zoning regulations; providing for findings of compliance with
regard to proposed subdivisions; providing for-abandonment or vacation of
streets upon payment of reasonabie consideration to the govermng body; and
provndmg other matters properly relaung thereto. .

The People af the State of Nevada represented in Senate and Assembly,
: do enact as follows ‘ ;

SECTION 1 NRS 278.160 is hereby amended to read as follows:
278.160 1. The master plan, with the accompanying [maps, dia-

grams, charts, descriptive matter ‘and reports,] charts, drawings, dia-

grams, schedules and reports, shall include such of the foIlowmg subject
matter or portions thereof as are appropriate to the city, county or region,
and as may be made the basis for the physical development thereof:

(a) Community design. Standards and principles governing the sub-
division of land and suggcstwe patterns for commumty des1gn and devel-
opment.

(b) Conservation plan. For the conservation, development and util-
ization of natural resources, including water and its hydraulic force, for-
ests, soils, rivers and other waters, harbors, fisheries, wildlife, minerals
and other natural resources. The plan shall also cover the reclamation of
land and waters, flood control, prevention and control of the pollution of
streams and other waters, rcgulatlou of the use of land in stream channels
and other areas required for the accomphshment of the conservation plan, .
prevention, control and correction of the erosmn of soxls, beaches, and
shores, and protection of watersheds. :

(c) Economic plan. Showing recommended schedules for the alloca-
tion and expenditure of public funds in order to provide for the econom-
1ca1 and tlmely execution of the vanous components of the plan

_ Original bill is_6__ pages long." ot 260
Contact the Research Library for ‘
a copy of the complefe bill.
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(REPRINTED WITH ADOPTED AMENDMENTS)
THIRD REPRINT S. B. 564

R ———

SENATE BILL NO. 564—SENATOR FOLEY
~ Marcu27, 1973

 Referred to Committee on Transportation

SUMMARY-Pcrmm certain county motor vehicles to be unmarked.
anl Note: No. (BDR 43-1819)

<>

. EXPLANATION—Matter in iralics is new; matter in brackets [ ] is
i ! malerial to be omitted.

* ANAC'I‘ to amend NRS 482.368, relating o registration of publicly owned. motor

vehicles, by permitting certain motor vehicles to be unmarked; and providing
* other matters properly relating thereto.

- The People af the State of Nevada, represented in Senate and Assembly,

do enact as follows:

- SecTiON 1. NRS 482.368 is hereby amended to read as follows:
482.368 1. [The] Except as provided in subsection 2, the depart-

‘ment shall provide suitable distinguishing plam . to be issued once every

5 years, except as provided in subsection 2,] for exempt vehicles. [owned

be the State of Nevada, or by any board, bureau, department, or com-

mission thereof, or any county, city, town, school district or irrigation
district in the state, which] Such plates shall be provided at cost and

“shall be displayed on such vehicles in the same manner as provided for

privately owned vehicles.

2. License plates furnished for: [such

~ (a) Such automobiles as are maintained for and used by the governor
or under the authority and direction of the state board of parole commis-
sioners, the state contractors’ board and auditors, the state fire marshal,
the investigation and narcotics division of the department of law enforce-
ment assistance [and investigators of the state gaming control board and
the attorney general, and one] and any authorzzed federal or out-of-state

~ law enforcement agency;

(b) One automobile used by the Nevada state prison, two automoblles

.used by the Nevada gu'ls training center, and four automobiles used by
the Nevada youth training center; and

(c) Automobiles maintained for and used by mve.mgators of the follow-
ing:
(1) The state gammg comrol board; :
(2) The division of brand inspection of the state deparmm of agn-

: culture,

Original bill is_2 _pages long.
Contact the Research Library for
a copy of the complete bill.
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ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 97—-COMMHTEE ON '
o TRANSPORTA’HON '
o ‘JA—NUARY "24, 19?3'
Referred to Cormmttee on Transportauon

' "SU'MMARY—~Creates vehicle” comnhance and enforcement sections with;,n motor

.. vehicle registration division of department of motor vehicles, and mcreases
o junsdlctxon of ﬁeld dealer mspectors Flscal Note: Ne (BDR 43-98)

ExPLANATrON——Maﬁer in itaIlcs is new matter in brackets[ ] is
: "7 miaterial to beomitted o

AN “ACT creatmg a section within the motor vehicle reg15trahon dmsxon of the
department of motor vehicles known as the vehicle comvlianée and enforce- -
< 'ment -section; increasing the )unsdtctlon of field dealer insvectors to include
- further statutory lens; increasing the jurisdiction of field dealer-inspectors to -
Eclude additional vehxcles, and providing - other matters prqperly relatmg
eneto ) .

The People of the Stare of Nevada represented in Senate and Ass‘embly,r
' do enact as. foilows :

: SECTION 1. -NRS 169.125 is hereby amended to read as follows
" '169 125 “Peace‘officer” includes:
* ‘The bailiff of the supreme court; -
2 Sheriffs of counties and their deputles
~ 3. Constables; = -
4.  Personnel of the Nevada highwav Datrol when exerc1smg the pohce

- powers specified in NRS 481. 150 and 481.180; "

5. [The inspector or field agents of the motor carrier division of the
department of motor vehxcles when exermsmg the police powars spec1ﬁed
in NRS 481.049; -

C 6. Members of and all mspectors empleyed by the ‘public service
commission of Nevada when exercising -those enforcement poWers cen-
ferred by chapters 704 to 706, inclusive, of NRS; : :

7. Marshals and policemen of cities and towns;

8. Parole and probation officers; - R

‘9. Special investigators employed by the office of any dlstnct attomey
or the attorney general; - :

10.- Arson investigators for fire departments Spec1aﬂy de51gnated by
the appomtmg authority;

Members of the Umvermty of Nevada System police departmem :

12 ‘The state fire marshal and hzs deputles' :

262

Original billis_3__ pages long. -
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a copy of the complete bill.
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A.B. 961

'ASSEMBLY. BILL NO. 961—COMMITTEE
ON TRANSPORTATION |

APRIL 15,1973

—_—
. Referred to Committee on Transportation

SUMM ARY—Permits transfer of moneys between accounts by department
. of motor vehicles. Flscal Note: No. (BDR $-2203)

-

. BXPLANATION—Matter in italics is new; matter in brackets [ Jis
material to be omitted.

AN ACT permitting the transfer of certain moneys between
accounts by department of motor vehicles.

g ' The People of the State of Nevada, represented in Senate and Assembly,
.’\ B X do enact as follows

SeECTION 1. The department. of motor vehicles is hereby authorized
to transfer $12,500 from funds appropriated for fiscal year 1972-1973
in the automation division account #201—4715 to the administrative
services- division account #201-4714 in order to make funds available
for bringing the department of motor vehicles’ building into waterproof
condition.

SEC. 2. Thls act shall become eﬁectwe upon passage and approval

~3 T OV 00 DD
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> Tds ~ Original bill is on file at
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A.B. 220

ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 220—MESSRS. GLOVER, SMALLEY, MAY,
HOWARD, BICKERSTAFF, DINI, JACOBSEN AND DREYER

FEBRUARY 5, 1973

Referred to Committee on Transportation
SUMMARY—Lowers cost of drivers’ licenses for person 70 years or older and

imgxses a $2 fee for obtaining a motorcycle endorsement, Fiscal Note: No.
(BDR 43-470)

D

ExrLaNATION—Matter in italics is new; matter in brackets [ ] is
material to be omitted.

AN ACT relating to drivers’ licenses; lowering fee imposed on persons 70 years or
older to obtain a license; imposing a $2 fee for obtaining a motorcycle endorse-
ment; and providing other matters properly relating thereto.

The People of the State of Nevada, represented in Senate and Assembly,
do enact as follows:

SecTioN 1. NRS 483.410 is hereby amended to read as follows:
h483.:10 1. For every driver's license issued [a $5 fee shall be
charged.
2. For ever reinstatement or duplication of a license or change of
name or address the following fees shall be charged:
Reinstatement of license after suspension, revocation or can-

(17T ooy Do o e e e Sy AR S
Duplicate license........... =1
Change of name....... 1
Change of address... SR

and service performed the following fees shall be charged:
A license issued to persons 70 years of age or older.................. $3
A license issued ‘to all other persons. SRS A Tl 5
Reinstatement of a license after suspension, revocation or

Cancetlmtion.. . L in s T s e e s I R C )
A duplicate license, change of name, change of address or

any combination....................ccoeceen..... 1

2. For every motorcycle endorsement to a driver's license a $2 fee
shall be charged.

3. A penalty of $5 shall be paid by each person renewing his license
after it has expired for a period of 30 days or more as provided in NRS
483.380 unless exempt under NRS 483.380.

Original bill is_2 pages long. 264 ;

Contact the Research Library for
a copy of the complete bill.
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| (REPRINTED WITH ADOPTED AMNDMENTS)
SECOND REPRINT A. B. 943

ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 943-——MR GLOVER
ArRL4, 1973 |

; :
) ~ Referred to Comnnttee on Transportauon
SUMMARY——Prowdes changes in trafﬁc laws. Fiscal Note: No. (BDR 43-485)

: Emmnou—Matter in italics is new; matter in brackets { ] is
material to be’ omitte

AN ACT relatmg to traffic 1aws, providing changes in rules of thc road; clanfymg
provisions; and provndmg other matters properly rclntmg thereto

The People of the State of Nevada, represented in Senate and Assembly,
do enact as follows : >

SECTION 1 NRS 484.259 is hereby amended to read as follows:
- 484.259 Unless spec1ﬁcally made applicable, the provisions of this
chapter, except those relating to driving under the influence of [drugs]
controlled substances or intoxicating liquor as provided in NRS 484.379,
shall not apply to persons, teams, motor vehicles and other equipment
while actually engaged in work upon the surface of a highway but shall
apply to such persons and vehicles when traveling to or from such work.

SEC. 2. NRS 484.283 is hereby amended to read as follows:

484.283 1. Whenever traffic is controlled by official traffic-control
devices exhibiting different colored lights, or colored lighted arrows, suc-
cessively one at a time or in combination as declared in the manual and
specifications. adopted by the department of highways, only the colors
green, yellow and red shall be used, except for special pedestrian-control
devices carrying a word legend as prov1ded in NRS 484.325. Such lights,
arrows and combinations thereof indicate and apply to drivers of vehicles
and pedestrians as provided in this section.

2. When the signal is circular green alone: ,

(a) Vehicular traffic facing such a signal may proceed stralght through
or turn right or left unless another device at such place prohibits either
or both such turns. Such vehicular traffic, including vehicles turning
right or left, shall yield the right of way to other vehicles and to pedes-

- trians lawfully within the intersection or an adjacent crosswalk at the

time such signal is exhibited.

(b) Pedestrians facing such a 51gnal may proceed across the h1gh— ;
way within any marked or unmarked crosswalk, unless directed other-
wise by another device as provided in NRS 484.325.

Original billis_5 pageslong. Al 265
Contact the Research Library for
a copy of the complete bill. -
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