PROPOSED REGULATION OF THE
STATE FIRE MARSHAL
L CB File No. R062-04

July 26, 2004

EXPLANATION — Matter in italicsis new; matter in brackets [omitted-material] is material to be omitted.

AUTHORITY: 881, 2, 4-16, 18-21, 24, 27-59, 61, 62, 64, 65, 67, 68 and 70-79, NRS 477.030;
8§83, 17, 23, 60, 63, 66 and 69, NRS 477.030 and 477.033; §22, NRS 477.030,
477.031 and 477.033; 8§25, NRS 477.030, 477.031, 477.032 and 477.033; §26,
NRS 477.030 and 477.032.

A REGULATION relating to fire; establishing requirements for obtaining a certificate of
registration as afire performer; requiring mattresses in correctional facilitiesin this State to
comply with certain standards; adopting certain publications by reference; making certain
changes to publications adopted by reference; revising the period for the renewal of ablaster’s
certificate; revising requirements related to commercial displays of fireworks and pyrotechnic
operators, revising requirements related to storage of fireworks; repealing certain provisions
relating to the approval of fire systems, requirements for combination paging alarm systems,
required equipment, tools and materials for the servicing and repair of fire extinguishers,
requirements for exits from portable buildings, requirements for containers for flammable or
combustible liquids and standards of construction for Type 1 exhaust systems; and providing
other matters properly relating thereto.

Section 1. Chapter 477 of NAC is hereby amended by adding thereto the provisions set
forth as sections 2 to 5, inclusive, of this regulation.

Sec. 2. “Authority having jurisdiction” means:

1. Except asotherwise provided in subsection 2 or 3, the State Fire Marshal.

2. Alocal government in a county whose population is 100,000 or more or which has
been converted into a consolidated municipality.

3. Alocal government in a county whose population islessthan 100,000 or which has not

been converted into a consolidated municipality if the local government has entered into an

-]--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



interlocal agreement with the State Fire Marshal to delegate to the local government the
authority or duties of the State Fire Marshal in that area.

Sec. 3. 1. Beforeaperson may act asa fire performer, the person must obtain a
certificate of registration as a fire performer from the State Fire Marshal.

2. An applicant for a certificate of registration as a fire performer must:

(a) Beanatural person whoisat least 21 years of age;

(b) Make awritten application for a certificate of registration to the State Fire Marshal on
aform provided by the State Fire Marshal;

(c) Submit to the State Fire Marshal a resume of the experience of the applicant and a
description of all safety precautions used by the applicant; and

(d) Pay an application fee of $27.50.

3. Asusedin thissection, “fire performer” meansan entertainer or other performer who
performswork for an audience using an open flame.

Sec. 4. 1. Unlessotherwise required by state statute or regulation or local ordinance, a
mattressin a correctional facility in this State must comply with ASTM E1354-04a and ASTM
F1870-99.

2. A copy of ASTM E1354-04a and ASTM F1870-99 is available from Global
Engineering Documents, 15 I nverness Way East, Englewood, Colorado 80112, or from the

American National Standards | nstitute at the | nternet address <http://webstore.ansi.org>, for

the price of $38 for each standard.
Sec. 5. 1. |Ifindividual or cumulative additionsto a building or structure in any 12-

month period exceed 25 percent of the square feet of floor space of the building or structure

2
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



that existed at the commencement of the 12-month period, the building or structure must
conform to the requirements for a new building or structure.

2. Asusedin thissection, “addition” means any extension or increasein the floor space
or height of a building or structure.

Sec. 6. NAC 477.010 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.010 Asused inthis chapter, unless the context otherwise requires, the words and terms
defined in NAC [4+#015} 477.020 to 477.270, inclusive, and section 2 of thisregulation have
the meanings ascribed to them in those sections.

Sec. 7. NAC 477.085 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.085 1. “Custodia carefacility” meansabuilding or apart of a building which is used
for lodging or boarding [feur} six or more persons who are incapable of caring for themselves
because of age or physical or mental limitations.

2. Theterm includes facilities such as homes for the aged, nurseries providing custodial care
for children funder} less than 6 years of age, adult group care facilities and facilities for the care
of the mentally retarded.

3. Theterm does not include day care facilities which do not provide lodging or boarding
for institutional occupants.

Sec. 8. NAC 477.103 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.103 “Fireextinguisher” means a device:

1. Containing powder, liquid or gases fwhieh} that can be expelled under pressure to

suppress or extinguish afire;

--3--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Whichistested, listed or approved by the Underwriters Laboratories Inc., Underwriters
Laboratories of Canada, [Factory-Mutual-Laberatory;} FM Global Technologies LLC, the U.S.
Coast Guard or a nationally recognized laboratory approved by the State Fire Marshal; and

3. Which is capable of achieving a minimum of one unit of classification of rating during
testing and listing by a nationally recognized testing laboratory.

Sec. 9. NAC 477.130 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.130 “I.C.C. container” means any container approved by the United States [Hterstate
Commerce-Commission} Surface Transportation Board for shipping any liquid, gas or solid
material of aflammable, toxic or other hazardous nature.

Sec. 10. NAC 477.250 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.250 [YniHerm] “ International Building Code” means the code published by the
International [Cenferenceof Buitding-Officials:} Code Council.

Sec. 11. NAC 477.255 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.255 [Yniferm] “ International Fire Code” means the code published fjeinthy by the

tals] I nternational

Code Council.

Sec. 12. NAC 477.260 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.260 “Uniform Mechanical Code” means the code published fjeinthy by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials . fand-thetnternational

Sec. 13. NAC 477.275 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.275 Where no specific standards or requirements are specified in this chapter or

contained within other applicable statutes, ordinances or bylaws, or within other codes or

-4
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



regulations adopted by the State Fire Marshal, compliance with the applicable standards of the
[National-Fire Protection-Association} N.F.P.A. or other nationally recognized fire saf ety
standards approved by the State Fire Marshal is prima facie evidence of compliance with the
intent of this chapter.

Sec. 14. NAC 477.280 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.280 1. PArherel Except for property owned by the State, where there is a conflict
between this chapter and any code, ordinance or regulation adopted by alocal authority, the
more stringent requirement providing the greatest safety from fire and for life to the public
applies.

2. Themodel codes adopted with modifications by the State Fire Marshal pursuant to this
chapter are enforceable jointly with the other provisions of this chapter.

3. Nothingin this section prohibits alocal government from adopting any code or ordinance
that is more stringent than the provisions of this chapter.

Sec. 15. NAC 477.281 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.281 1. The State Fire Marshal hereby adopts by reference the following nationally
recognized codes with additions and deletions as noted in NAC 477.283:

(a) PIniferm} International Fire Code, {2997 2003 edition, Volume 1. A copy is available

from [

--5--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



=1 the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, lllinois
60478-5795, or from the I nternational Code Council at the I nternet address

<http://www.iccsafe.org/e/cateqory.html> at the price of [$136:15:} $53 for members and $70

for nonmembers, plus $5.99 for shipping and handling.

(b) [Sriferm} International Building Code, 2997} 2003 edition, Volumes 1 and 2. A copy is

available from the International {Cenference-of Buitding-Offictals;} Code Council, 4051 West

Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, I1linois 60478-5795, or from the I nternational Code

Council at the I nternet address <http://www.iccsafe.org/e/category.html> at the price of

—(e)} $65 for members, plus $5.99 for shipping and handling, and $86 for nonmembers, plus
$6.99 for shipping and handling.

(c) Uniform Mechanical Code, 1997} 2003 edition. A copy is available from the
International [Cenference-of Buitding} Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials,
5001 East Philadelphia Street, Ontario, California 91761-2816, or from the | nternational
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials at the I nternet address

<http://publications.iapmo.org> at the price of {$42.

LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



and $89 for nonmembers, plus $8 for shipping and handling.

2. In addition to the codes adopted pursuant to subsection 1, the State Fire Marshal
hereby adopts by reference codes and standards 10, 11, 13, 13D, 13R, 14, 15, 17, 17A, 20, 22,
24, 25, 30B, 50, 50B, 52, 58, 72, 86, 90A, 90B, 96, 99, 110, 111, 140, 160, 385, 407, 409, 410,

704, 1123, 1126, 1403 and 2001 of the National Fire Codes to supplement other codes adopted

in this chapter. A copy of the National Fire Codesis available from the N.F.P.A., 1

Batterymarch Park, Qunicy, Massachusetts 02169-7471, at the price of $1,120.

3. Whereno specific codes or standards are specified in the | nternational Fire Code, the

applicable standards of the N.F.P.A. may be used.

Sec. 16. NAC 477.283 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.283 1. Thefollowing changes are made to the [2997} 2003 edition of the [Jriform}
International Fire Code as adopted by reference by the State Fire Marshal:

(a) Section {20314} 105.6.35 isrevised to read as follows: “ An operational permit is
required to operate a place of assembly with an occupant load of 100 or more, or as otherwise
required by the authority having jurisdiction.”

(b) Section 108 is deleted.

-7--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) To section {3068} 202 under the Group I1-1 heading is added: “All portions of acare

facility which houses patients or residents which is classified by the State Board of Health as
‘Category 2, and which has an occupant load of more than 10 residents, is classified asan ‘I-1’
occupancy classification . [-Group-H-DBivision-L1"

— o EositaR---

(d) Section 508.3 isrevised by adding a second paragraph to read as follows: “ Subject to the
approval of the fire authority, if the fire flow is not available for adequate fire protection, an
approved automatic fire sprinkler system must be installed throughout the building or buildings.
The sprinkler system must meet the requirements of the appropriate N.F.P.A. standard. The
provisions of this paragraph do not apply if afire sprinkler system is otherwise required by this
chapter or the adopted codes .” [-aetuding-sections103.1:2-903-and-1003.1-2-of the- Uniform
FireCode]

--8--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(e) Section 508.5.7 is deleted and replaced with: “ A clear space of at least 3 feet must be
maintained around the front and sides of a fire department connection. A fire department
connection must be visible from the approved fire apparatus access road and must be
accessiblein a direct and unobstructed approved route.

(f) Section 903.2.1.6 isdeleted and replaced with: “ Casinos are classified as drinking
establishments and must be designed and built with a sprinkler system classified asan
ordinary Hazard Group 2.”

(g) Section 903.2.7 isrevised by adding a second paragraph to read as follows: “ An R-1 or
R-2 occupancy that has more than two stories must have an N.F.P.A. 13 system installed. An R-1

or R-2 occupancy that has two stories or less must have an N.F.P.A. 13 system or an N.F.P.A.

13-R system installed.”

--0--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(h) Section 903.2.10 isrevised by adding a new paragraph to read as follows: “ A building

that ismore than 2 storiesin height, including any height added by usable floor space, must
have automatic sprinkler systemsinstalled throughout.”

(i) Section 903.3.1.2 isrevised to read asfollows. “Where allowed, an R-1 or R-2 building
that has two stories or less must have automatic sprinkler systemsinstalled throughout in
accordancewith N.F.P.A. 13 or N.F.P.A. 13R. An R-1 or R-2 building that has more than two
stories must have automatic sprinkler systems installed throughout in accordance with
N.F.P.A. 13"

() Section 906.1 isrevised to read as follows: “ When required, portable fire extinguishers
must beinstalled in all group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R-1, R-2, R-4 and S occupancies. No
exceptions will apply.”

(K) In sections907.2.12, 907.9.2 and 1019.1.8, “ 75 feet” is deleted and replaced with “55
feet.”

(I) Section 907.10.1 isrevised by adding the following exceptions:

“(3) Electrical roomsand mechanical roomsthat are not normally occupied and are

less than 400 square feet.

--10--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(4) Janitor closets.

(5) Storageroomsthat are lessthan 400 square feet.

(6) Elevator cabs.

(7) Individual work areas or offices and private toilets serving individual work areas or
offices.

(8) Individual inmate sleeping accommodations and patient sleeping rooms except as
required by section 907.10.1.3.”

(m) In section 907.10.2, “ 70 dBA” isdeleted and replaced with “ 80 dBA” and “60 dBA” is
deleted and replaced with “ 80 dBA.”

(n) Section 3301.1.3 is amended fso-that-seetion7802-3+eads} to read as follows: “The
possession, manufacture, storage, sale, use and handling of fireworks fisprohibited-fa} are
prohibited except where permitted by local ordinance.” fhasbeen-adepted-which-prohibitsthe
—()-To-Article 82}

(0) To section 3801.1 isadded: “In the event of a conflict between any provisionin this

FArtiele} chapter and the regulations of the Board for the Regulation of Ligquefied Petroleum

Gas, the regulations of the Board take precedence.”

--11--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



--12--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



b Tl puild el
2. Thefollowing changes are made to the {2997} 2003 edition of the [Uniferm}

I nternational Building Code as adopted by the State Fire Marshal:

--13--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



—b)} To section {205} 112 is added the following provision: “This section does not apply to
the State Fire Marshal of Nevada.”

(b) Section 303.1 isrevised by adding a new category “ Casinos’ to subsection A-2.

(c) From section 403.1 is deleted the phrase “* * * more than 75 feet,” and to that section is
added “* * * more than 55 feet above the lowest level of access for avehicle of thefire
department.”

(d) To section [403:5:4} 403.6 is added: “L oudspeakers or horns for afire alarm must achieve
at least 80 decibels of sound in al areas within the protected property.”

(e) To section [403.6-1;} 403.8, the following provisions are added:

(1) “All equipment contained within the feentral-statienforeontrol} fire command center
must be tested [euarterhy} annually by a person approved by the authority having jurisdiction.
Systems terminating within the [eentral-station-for-contrel]} fire command center must be tested
asrequired by the local authority having jurisdiction according to a schedule which is
commensurate with the size and complexity of the facility being protected and the systems
involved. All equipment for the safety of life must be reset and certified by a person approved by
the authority having jurisdiction after being tested. A log of the tests required by this section
must be available for inspection by the authority having jurisdiction. Graphic display annunciator
panels may be required if the complexity of the systems warrant. Testing must follow procedures
which are developed by the designer, manufacturer and nationally recognized standards of good
practice as approved by the authority having jurisdiction.”

(2) “The [eentral-station-fer-control} fire command center must be housed in aroom

separated from the building in which it is located by noncombustible construction rated at a

--14--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



minimum of 2 hours. The room used for that station must be provided an exterior door if

possible.”

—{g)Fo-section403.9} To section 403.12, at the end of the last sentence, isadded: “* * * or

an activation of any fire alarm system or a power failure.”

(g) Section 403.15 isdeleted and replaced with: “ A smoke control system must be provided
and must meet the regquirements of Chapter 9.

(h) Section 903.2.2.1 isrevised by adding a new paragraph to read as follows: “In high
schools where automatic fire sprinkler systems are provided, the automatic fire sprinkler
systems for the automotive and woodwor king shops must be ordinary hazard group 1
automatic fire sprinkler systems.

(i) In section 907.2.12 “ 75 feet” is deleted and replaced with “ 55 feet.”

--15--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(j) Section 907.9.1 isrevised by adding the following exceptions:

“(3) Electrical roomsand mechanical roomsthat are not normally occupied and are
less than 400 square feet.

(4) Janitor closets.

(5) Storageroomsthat are lessthan 400 square feet.

(6) Elevator cabs.

(7) Individual work areas or offices and private toilets serving individual work areas or
offices.

(8) Individual inmate sleeping accommodations and patient sleeping rooms except as
required by section 907.2.10.1.3.”

(k) In section 907.9.2:

(1) “70dBA” isdeleted and replaced with “ 80 dBA”;
(2) “60dBA” isdeleted and replaced with “ 80 dBA”; and
(3) “75feet” isdeleted and replaced with “ 55 feet.”

() I'n section 1008.1.8.7, exception 3isrevised to read asfollows: “1n stairways serving
buildings other than high-rise buildings, doors are permitted to be locked on the side opposite
the egress side, provided that the doors can be opened from the egress side. Except for exit
discharge doors, the doors must automatically unlock upon the activation of a fire alarm
system or a fire sprinkler alarm and for a power failure.

(m) Section 1019.1.8 isdeleted and replaced with: “In a building having afloor level used
for human occupancy which is more than 55 feet above or below the level of access for avehicle

of the fire department, all required exit enclosures must be pressurized in accordance with this

--16--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



section . fand-section-905:} Pressurization must occur automatically upon activation of an

approved fire dlarm system. The exception and the relief venting provisions remain as written.”

-17--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



--18--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Sec. 17. NAC 477.300 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.300 1. All applicationsfor licenses or certificates must be made to the State Fire
Marshal in the manner required by this chapter. A person who performs any of the following
work in this State, other than as the employee of another, must obtain alicense in accordance
with this chapter and chapter 477 of NRS and shall require each person employed by him to

perform that work to obtain the appropriate certificate of registration:

--19--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(8) Sdling, servicing, maintaining or installing any fire extinguisher, engineered or pre-
engineered fixed fire extinguishing system, fire alarm system, fire detection system, automatic
fire suppression system or fire standpipe system.

(b) Cleaning of a Type 1 hood and duct and the removal of fuel.

(c) Blasting and using commercial explosives.

(d) Using and handling of pyrotechnics.

(e) Installing medical gas systems.

(f) Selling and installing heat detectors which will be used as devices for the early warning of
fires.

2. The State Fire Marshal or his authorized representative may inspect vehicles, equipment,
buildings, devices, premises or any area to be used in performing the activities permitted by the
license or certificate.

3. Alicenseor certificate issued by the State Fire Marshal remains the property of the State
Fire Marshal Division and must be renewed as required by NAC 477.310. The license or
certificate is not transferable, is revocable for cause and, except as otherwise provided in this
chapter, will not be issued to any person who has not reached 18 years of age.

4. A licensee shall comply with any regulation adopted by alocal authority which is more
stringent.

5. All applications for alicense for the installation and maintenance of systems for
protection from fire must be accompanied by aletter of certification from a manufacturer or
supplier of the system or material or parts for the system stating that the licensee has received
parts and materials for the installation, maintenance, servicing, testing and inspection of those

materials, items or systems.

--20--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



6. Any firm having more than one office doing businessin Nevada which must be licensed
by the State Fire Marshal must designate one office as the principal office and pay the standard
fee for each class of license for work to be performed. Except for licenses for the sale at retail of
fire extinguishers, each additional office must be licensed as a branch office. Each branch office
must pay the prescribed fee of $110 for each class of license for the work to be performed by that
branch. If abranch office performs work which is not done by the principal office, the branch
office shall be deemed to be the principal office for that class of license and must pay the full fee.

7. A holder of acertificate of registration must be present at all job sites on which work
requiring alicense pursuant to this section will be performed.

8. [On-andafterJanuary-1-2003-a} A designer of fire sprinkler and alarm systems must
hold aLevel 1 certification from the National Institute for Certification in Engineering
Technologies (NICET) , be licensed as a professional engineer pursuant to chapter 625 of NRS
or hold an equivalent certification. To obtain further information and copies of materialsto
receive aLevel |l certification from the National Institute for Certification in Engineering
Technologies, adesigner of fire sprinkler and alarm systems may contact the National Institute
for Certification in Engineering Technologies, 1420 King Street, Alexandria, Virginia 22314-
2794, telephone [{800)-787-0034.} 888.476.4238.

Sec. 18. NAC 477.311 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.311 Except as otherwise provided for a certificate for blasting:

1. Anapplicant for acertificate of registration must pass awritten examination. The

applicant must receive a passing score on each part taken. [Fhe-examination-may-be

--21--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Licensure by another state, or other training and certification recognized by the State Fire
Marshal, may be considered in evaluating an applicant’s qualifications.

Sec. 19. NAC 477.312 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.312 The examinations administered by the State Fire Marshal are based on the

20
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



—(e)—TFheapphcable provisions-of-thischapter} National Fire Codes, 2004 edition, published

by the N.F.P.A.

Sec. 20. NAC 477.313is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.313 1. The State Fire Marshal will schedule the various examinations so that an
applicant may take his examination within 90 days after the date of his application. Examinations
will be conducted at the State Fire Marshal’ s office in Carson City during business hours with an
appointment. Examinations for certificates of registration will also be conducted by appointment
in Elko and Las Vegas. No appointment for an examination will be made until the applicant
submits all required documentation to the State Fire Marshal’s office in Carson City.

2. Anapplicant who fails the examination or a part of the examination must wait 15 days
after the date of the examination and pay the fapptication} fee for retaking an examination set
forth in NAC 477.325 before taking the test or failed part of the test again. A person may not
take the test for the same class of license more than threetimesin 1 calendar year.

3. Anapplicant who aready has a certificate in one classification may apply for licensing or
registration in a higher classification and, upon payment of the prescribed fee, will be tested only
on that part of the examination pertaining to the higher classification.

Sec. 21. NAC 477.320 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.320 1. When the State Fire Marshal receives written notice fer-a-cemplaint} aleging
fraud, misrepresentation, mal practice or incompetence on the part of any person licensed or

certified under this chapter, he will conduct an investigation of the allegations. The investigation

--23--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



will concentrate on violations of this chapter, deceptive trade practices as set forth in chapter 598
of NRS and other pertinent criminal and civil violations set forth in NRS. The use of any
unauthorized, faulty or otherwise unacceptable equipment discovered during an investigation

may be prohibited pending afina determination. [Fheperson-being-Hvestigated-shall-replace-or

1 A license or certificate will

be suspended during an investigation if the investigation reveal s conditions which the State Fire
Marshal considers an imminent threat to public safety.

2. A person who has been denied an original or renewal license or certificate by the State
Fire Marshal may request an administrative hearing within 10 days after notice of denial. A
written request must be sent to the State Fire Marshal. The State Fire Marshal, upon receipt of a
reguest for an administrative hearing, will take necessary action to schedule an administrative
hearing.

3. Thefailure on the part of an applicant to pass tests required in this chapter does not
congtitute grounds to request an administrative hearing.

4. |If an administrative hearing officer finds that the State Fire Marshal has acted correctly,
he may require restitution to the State Fire Marshal for the costs of the administrative hearing. If
the administrative hearing officer finds that the applicant, licensee or holder of the certificate is
guilty of alesser offense, the State Fire Marshal may require the applicant, licensee or holder, as
appropriate, to receive further training or be retested, or both.

5. Anadministrative hearing does not preclude the State Fire Marshal from proceeding with
acriminal investigation. Any conviction resulting from a criminal investigation may be used as
primafacie evidence in an administrative hearing.

Sec. 22. NAC 477.323 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--24--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477.323 1. A person shall not store a hazardous material in excess of the amount set forth
in the [Yniferm} | nternational Fire Code, as adopted pursuant to NAC 477.281, unless he has
been issued a permit by the State Fire Marshal to store that material. A permit must be renewed
annually.

2. Permits may be revoked or suspended when, after investigation, the State Fire Marshal
determines that:

(a) The permit isbeing used by a person other than the person to whom it was issued.

(b) The permitisbeing used for alocation other than that for which it was issued.

(c) Any of the conditions or limitations set forth in the permit have been violated.

(d) The holder of the permit has failed, refused or neglected to comply with any order or
notice served upon him under the provisions of this chapter within the time provided therein.

(e) A false statement or misrepresentation asto amaterial fact was made in the application
for the permit or the plans on which the permit was based.

3. The State Fire Marshal may suspend or revoke any permit if an inspection or
investigation reveal s a hazardous condition that endangers the safety of any person, or if the
holder of the permit is not in compliance with this section. The State Fire Marshal may reinstate
a suspended permit after the holder of the permit has paid the annual fee and corrected all
deficienciesidentified. A permit that has been revoked will not be reissued. A suspension will
not exceed 24 months, after which the permit will be reissued or revoked.

4. Except as otherwise provided in subsection 5, a permit may be issued to store, transport
on site, dispense, use or handle hazardous materials in excess of the amount listed in the

Jniferm] I nternational Fire Code, [2997} 2003 edition, section [405:4;} 105, for a fee of $90.

--25--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



5. Thefee established by subsection 4, or any portion of it, may be waived by the State Fire
Marshal. The State Fire Marshal may issue a permit for other facilities or appliances listed in
section 105 of the fUniferm} | nternational Fire Code, {2997 2003 edition, for afee of $55, and
in addition thereto may charge afee of $38.50 per hour, or any fraction thereof, for inspection
services and an amount equal to the actual expenses incurred for travel, salaries and
administrative expenses. The State Fire Marshal may issue an annual permit for the manufacture
of explosives, blasting agents or fireworks for afee of $1,100, and in addition thereto may
charge afee of $110 for each building or structure at the facility and an amount equal to the
actual expensesincurred for travel, salaries and administrative expenses.

6. The $60 surcharge required by NRS 477.045 will be collected on all permitsto store
hazardous materials, in addition to any other fees.

7. A permit expires 1 year after the last day of the calendar month in which the permit was
issued, unless a different expiration date is noted on the permit.

8. Revocation or suspension of a permit does not preclude the State Fire Marshal from
proceeding with a criminal investigation. Evidence from a criminal investigation may be used as
evidence in an administrative hearing for the revocation or suspension of a permit.

9. If aholder of apermit or an applicant for a permit intends to terminate the storage,
dispensing, handling or use of hazardous materials at afacility, the holder or applicant must
submit a plan to the State Fire Marshal outlining the proposed termination of the storage,
dispensing, handling or use of the hazardous materials at least 30 days before the date on which
the facility isto be closed. The plan must demonstrate that the reported quantities of materials
have been or will be transported, disposed of or removed in a manner that presents no hazardous

conditions to any person or property.

--26--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Sec. 23. NAC 477.325 is hereby amended to read as follows:
477.325 1. Except as otherwise provided in this chapter, the schedule of fees for:

(a) A licensetoingtall or maintain portable fire extinguishers and fixed systemsis as

follows:
(1) TypeA for full service of portable fire extingUIShers........ccocvceverveerevesere e $440.00°
(2) Type B for portable fire extinguishers without hydrostatic service...........cccceeu.e... 357.50

(3) TypeB, Cor B, D for Type B with hydrostatic service (C is low pressure, D
13 a0 gl 0 =SS U = )0 o) TS 357.50

(4) TypeE for fixed fire extinguishing systems:

(1) E-1for hoOd/dUCE SYSLEIMS.......couiieeirieireiiereee e e 137.50
(I1) E-2for al other SYStEMS ......ccccce i 137.50
(1) BOtN E=L NG E-2 oo se s ese s esesse 275.00
(5) TYpPEFfOr fIr@ @Al ...t 440.00
(6) Type G for automatic sprinkler system (includes G-U) ........ccocevevvrirenieeieneeiene 440.00

(7) Type G-U for underground fire sprinkler service and private hydrant

MAINTENANCE AN FEPAIT .....eveieeeieiie e e et e st e e s estesbesrestestesresbesreeresresnnenens 247.50
(8) TypeH for hood and dUCE ClEANING .......ccceiririeriireeereeee e 440.00
(9) TypeH-E for E-1 licensed companieswanting an H license..........ccccecvvvvvvnnnne, 137.50
(10) Type | for Standpipe SYSLEMS......ccoiveiiieerese e 440.00
(11) Typel-G for G licensed companies wanting an | license.........cccoeeeeveerierieneeiene 137.50
(12) Type Jfor N.F.P.A., Standard 13-D SyStEMS .......ccccerrerereeeererreeieseeseesieseeseesee s 440.00
(13) Type G-Jfor G licensed companies wanting to do Standard 13-D work............. 137.50
(14) Blaster'scertificate Of regiStration .........ccccoeeereieneneneneeeee e 55.00
27

LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04

__ - | Formatted: Tabs: 0.2", Left +

0.4", Left + 0.6", Left + 6.5",
Right,Leader: ...




(15) fFive-year} Two-year renewal of ablaster’scertificate .......coovvvvveecenieiececennen, 55.00

(16) Type MG licensetoinstall medical gas SySteMS........cvevvvreireeneneereesenenes 247.50

(17) Type EWD licenseto sell or install heat detectors ..........ccoceoreeeeiiniciiciieneene 110.00
(b) A certificate of registration (€aCh ClaSs) ........ccoeereirerrie e 71.50
(c) Renewal of acertificate of registration..........ccceceverereriesesie e 33.00
(d) Issuance of aduplicate license or CertifiCate.........ovimiriririirienereeee e 11.00
(e) Change of information on acertificate Or liCENSE........coocvverereiirreeee e 11.00
(f) A licensefor each branch office, per license class........ccccoovvvvivvvccenececcscec e 110.00
(g9) Anannual license for the sale at retail of al types of fire extinguishers...........cccceveeeee 27.50

(h) Anannua licensefor the sale at retail of only disposable fire extinguishers which are not
=0 81 = o o) A= W ot (= T 11.00

(i) Retaking an examination or any part of an examination............cccceverriveresieneienienennens 22.00

__ - | Formatted: Tabs: 0.2", Left +
« 0.4", Left + 6.5", Right,Leader: ...

|

(1) A certificate of registration and license for codes and regulations in interior

Formatted: Tabs: 0.2", Left +
0.4", Left + 0.6", Left + 6.5",
Right,Leader: ...

(k) Renewal of acertificate of registration and license for codes and regulationsin

g1 = (T g0 (= Lo o IS 50.00
(I Annual certificate of registration for installers of medical gas systems.........ccccceceveenene 71.50
(m) A copy of the regulations of the State Fire Marshal ...........ccccovevvievereriencecescseseneens 11.00

2. Thefeesfor alicense do not apply to this state or its political subdivisions. The feesfor
certificates of registration apply in all cases. A certificate of registration operates as alicense for
a person to perform a specific job for a company licensed pursuant to this chapter and chapter

477 of NRS.

--28--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



3. The State Fire Marshal will refund the fee for alicense, less an administrative fee of
$38.50, if awritten request for arefund, stating that the licensee has not, after being licensed,
engaged in any of the activities for which the license isissued, isreceived by the State Fire
Marshal within 30 days after the date of the issuance of the license.

4, Thefollowing fees are established for the administrative and regulatory services of the
State Fire Marshal Division:

(&) All copy service will be at the rate of $2.75 for the first copy and 55 cents for each page
thereafter for each file opened.

(b) Feesfor investigative services are asfollows:

(1) For expert testimony rendered by the Divisionin acivil proceeding, the fee of $110 for
each hour of testimony or research will be charged.

(2) Theactua costs for an investigation must be paid by the person investigated if heis
found guilty.

(3) Investigative and hearing costs must be paid by the person investigated, if the hearing
officer findsin favor of the State Fire Marshal.

(c) Thefeefor theissuance of alicense or certificate of occupancy is $22. The State Fire
Marshal will issue a certificate of occupancy:

(1) Annually for alicensed facility; or
(2) For afacility whichisnot licensed, annually after an inspection and the removal of
deficiencies, if any.

(d) The State Fire Marsha may charge afee for any other inspection services. The rate for

thisfee is $38.50 per hour or any fraction thereof. The first inspection may be conducted at no

--20--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



charge. A fee for subsequent reinspectionswill be charged for the actual cost of travel, salaries
and administrative expenses in addition to the inspection fee.

(e) Thefeefor witnessing any test for acceptance is $22 for each test requiring a separate fee
for certification.

(f) A fee may be charged for the costs associated with providing training programs. The State
Fire Marshal may waivethisfeeif areasonable justification for doing so is provided.

(9) Instructional supplies and materials will be supplied at the approximate cost of providing
them.

(h) Feesfor instructors are $22 per hour, or as set by contract for specific classes, plus per
diem and travel expenses.

(i) Any additional costs for service will be added, as well as an administrative fee of 5.5
percent of the total cost of each program.

()) Costsof certification are based upon hours of training, but will not exceed $22. Fees will
be charged for any certification other than:

(1D Initia firefighter certification | and Il for a member of avolunteer fire department; or
(2) Certification for hazardous materials awareness and operations for al first responders

for agovernmental agency.

(k) Additional fees equal to those charged for initial testing will be charged for retesting
those who fail.

() The State Fire Marshal will not collect fees pursuant to this section from a person if athird
party, such as the employer of the person, pays that fee.

(m) Any service provided by the State Fire Marshal Division may be billed at the rate of

$38.50 per hour or the actual cost of providing the service, whichever is greater.

--30--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(n) Any service performed by a specia deputy on behalf of the State Fire Marshal may be
billed, pursuant to an interagency agreement, at the rate of $38.50 per hour, the actual cost of
providing the service, or any other rate specified by this chapter. The State Fire Marshal may
allow such fees or any part thereof to be collected and used by the agency supporting the special
deputy.

(o) Approval for equipment or materials which are not on alist published by a nationally
recognized testing laboratory, inspection agency or other organization concerned with product
evaluation |5} will be issued annually for a fee of $550 per product, $38.50 per hour of research
and actual expensesincurred in evaluating the product. If a product or material is not approved,
there will be charged a fee of $38.50 per hour of research and actual expensesincurred in
evaluating the product, except that the minimum fee is $165. Approval of a product lapsesif the:

(1) Product is modified;

(2) Name of the product or person manufacturing the product is changed;
(3) Ownership of the company is changed;

(4) Use of the product is changed; or

(5) Annual feeisnot paid.

(p) Requestsfor statistical information received before the publication of the annual report
will be supplied as available. The administrative cost to receive such statistical information will
be calculated and assessed in accordance with this section.

5. The State Fire Marsha may establish a fee for supplying copies of the annual report to
persons and agencies other than fire, legislative and state agencies. The fee will be limited to the

actual cost of the publication and distribution of the report, plus an administrative fee of $38.50.

--31--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



6. The State Fire Marsha may refund all or part of any fee if he deemsit appropriate. To be
eligible for atraining refund, aregistrant must give not less than 72 hours' notice before
removing his name from the registration list. The State Fire Marshal may require the registrant to
provide written documentation of the notice.

7. For aplanreview, the State Fire Marshal will collect an investigation fee in accordance

with section [2075:2} 108 of the [1997-edition-of-the UniformFire Codeas-amended by

paragraph-(e)y-of-subsection-1-of- NAC477.283} I nternational Building Code.
Sec. 24. NAC 477.330 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477330 1. A licensee shall maintain accurate records of all service performed by him and
all installations and service agreements made by him. These records must be made available for
inspection by the State Fire Marshal or his representatives during the normal hours of business of
the licensee.

2. The State Fire Marshal will keep alist of the names, addresses and numbers of the
licenses of all licensees. The record of all numbers will be available for inspection.

3. Any change of location of alicensee must be reported to the office of the State Fire
Marshal, in writing, within 7 days after the change. A new license will be issued upon
notification and payment of the prescribed fee.

4. A licensee shall provide to the State Fire Marshal with the initial application for a
license and with each application for renewal of a license a copy of at least one agreement
between the licensee and a company that has fhydretesting} hydrostatic testing facilities
approved by the United States Department of Transportation and soft shell Frydretesting]
hydrostatic testing facilities not required to be approved by the United States Department of

Transportation, pursuant to which the company with the fhydretesting} hydrostatic testing

--32--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



facilitieswill provide services relating to fhydretesting} hydrostatic testing to the licensee. If the
agreement is cancelled or otherwise terminated, the licensee shall forthwith notify the State Fire
Marshal of the cancellation or termination of the agreement.

Sec. 25. NAC 477.333is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.333 [} The State Fire Marshal will, in accordance with NRS 477.032, issue a
certificate of registration and license for codes and regulations in interior design to a person who
successfully completes a specialized training course that has been approved by the State Fire

Marshal.

Sec. 26. NAC 477.3338 is hereby amended to read asfollows:

--33--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477.3338 For each project in interior design by aholder of a certificate of registration and
license for codes and regulationsin interior design, the holder shall submit to the authority
having jurisdiction a plan that lists the types and uses of interior materials and furnishings which
the holder will be using in the project of interior design, so that the authority having jurisdiction
can determine whether the material's, furnishings and plan comply with the codes. The authority
having jurisdiction may charge a reasonable fee for making such a determination.

Sec. 27. NAC 477.335 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477335 1. All pre-engineered or engineered fixed fire extinguishing systems, fire alarm

systems, standpipe systems or sprinkler systems must be inspected in accordance with schedules

recommended in the appropriate adopted standards , fand-in-the“Fire Protection-Systems;

HaspectionTFest-and-Maintenance-Manual, "} as published by the N.F.P.A. Those inspections,
other than fthe-annual} a required inspection and certification, may be conducted by any person,

including an employee of afirm, who, in the opinion of the authority having jurisdiction, has

sufficient knowledge of the system to conduct such an inspection and who will maintain an

accurate record of such inspections of the system in the designated place for each system.

—3 Theauthority having jurisdiction may inspect afire protection system at any time . fthe
contractor-tspresent} All work must comply with the standards adopted for the system being
installed. The methods or equipment used in the installation must not vary from those required
by the plans pursuant to which the fire protection system is being installed and the applicable

standard for that fire protection system.

--34--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Sec. 28. NAC 477.340 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477340 1. The provisions of NAC 477.340 to 477.370, inclusive, prescribe the
requirements for the licensing of persons engaged in the sale, leasing, installation or servicing of
fire systems and components of fire systems.

2. Theprovisions of NAC 477.340to 477.370, inclusive, apply to all:

(a) Personswithin or conducting business within the State unless specifically excepted; and

(b) Fire systems and componentsinstalled within the State after November 27, 1978.

3. Theprovisions of NAC 477.340 to 477.370, inclusive, do not apply to municipal fire
alarm systems in any municipality whose population is {56,006} 100,000 or more.

Sec. 29. NAC 477.3465 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.3465 A person who wishes to engage in the sale, installation, repair, restoration or
testing for maintenance of heat detectors which will be used as devices for the early warning of
fires must possess a feertificate-efregistration} license issued by the State Fire Marshal. Each
applicant for such afeertificate-efregistration} license must provide a certification from a
manufacturer of the type of heat detector to be used by the applicant or firm engaged in the sale

of the heat detector that the applicant has received instruction and training in the installation,

repair, testing and inspection of the heat detector to be used by the applicant. [Fhe-apphicant-rmust

Sec. 30. NAC 477.350 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--35--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477.350 1. Nofire system, device or component of any fire system may be sold, leased or
installed in this State unlessiit is approved, labeled or listed by Underwriters Laboratories Inc.,
Underwriters' Laboratories of Canada, [Factory-Mutual-Researeh-Global-Corperation} FM
Global Technologies LLC or any other testing laboratory approved by the State Fire Marshal as
being qualified to test such systems or devices or if an approved listing from a testing laboratory
is not available for a system, device or a component, by the State Fire Marshal on the basis of a
practical test or examination and payment of the required fee by the person who is requesting
approval of the system, device or component by the State Fire Marshal.

2. Inaddition to other provisions of NAC 477.340 to 477.370, inclusive, fire systems must
comply with standards published by the N.F.P.A. and the International {Cenference-efBuiding
Officials] Code Council.

3. Where smoke detectors are required by any statute, regulation or ordinance, evidence of
approval must be furnished to the purchaser at the time of purchase or delivery. The evidence
must be alisting or label from one of the approved laboratories.

4. All new structures built for residential purposes which are not otherwise required by any
statute, regulation or ordinance to be equipped with smoke detectors or other fire systems must
be equipped with smoke detectors that have been approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

Sec. 31. NAC 477.365 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477365 1. Thedistributor or installer of afire aarm system must submit evidence of his
capability to provide for any needed repair and restoration of the system within 24 hours after
being notified of afire or fault in the system. The evidence of that capability is subject to
approval by the State Fire Marshal and must include a showing that the distributor or installer

has:

--36--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



() The necessary equipment and qualified personnel to perform the service;

(b) The necessary stock of parts and devices; and

(c) A valid license issued by the State Contractors’ Board.

2. Wherefire aarm systems are installed, a satisfactory agreement for the maintenance of
the system must be provided. A licensed company shall give a 30-day notice to the owner, the
occupant |5} and the authority having jurisdiction fane-the State Fire-Marshal} before the
company may discontinue service to the owner and the occupant. All systems must be under the
supervision of qualified persons. These persons shall have proper tests and inspections made at
prescribed intervals and have general charge of all aterations and additions to the systems under
their supervision. A copy of the maintenance agreement, along with proof that the firm or
company which will provide the maintenance is adequately covered by liability insurance, must
be submitted by the firm or company to the local fire department having jurisdiction.

3. Detailed plans of alarm systems must be submitted to the [State Fire Marshal-forreview
ane-te-thel authority having jurisdiction. The specifications must state that the installation will
conform to applicable standards and meet the approval of [that-autherity-} the authority having
jurisdiction. The specifications must include the specific tests which may be required to meet the
approval of fthat-autherity-] the authority having jurisdiction. Plans must be drawn to an
indicated scale or be suitably dimensioned and must be made so that they can be easily
reproduced. Plans must contain sufficient detail to enable the authority having jurisdiction to
evaluate the effectiveness of the system. Plans must be submitted to and approved by the [State
Fire-Marshal-and-thel authority having jurisdiction before the system may be installed. Where
field conditions necessitate any substantial change from the approved plan, the corrected plan

showing the system as actually installed must be submitted to the [State-Fire Marshal-and-the}

--37--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



authority having jurisdiction. Plans fthat-have been-approved-by-the State Fire- Marshall must be

onthejob site at all times when work is being performed pursuant to that plan at that site.

4. All areasin ahigh-rise building protected by afire alarm system and all areas protected
by afire alarm system must be provided with sufficient notification devices to achieve 80
decibels of sound at any occupied space within the area protected. All other occupancies must
have an alarm system or systems which produce a sound that exceeds the prevailing equivalent
sound level in the room or space by 15 decibels, or exceeds any maximum sound level with a
duration of at least 30 seconds by at least 5 decibels, whichever islouder. The level of sound for
the alarm signal must not exceed 120 decibels.

Sec. 32. NAC 477.385 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477385 1. A personwhoislicensedto install or maintain a portable fire extinguisher or
fixed fire extinguishing system or sell at retail or provide as a part of other sales at retail a
portable fire extinguisher or fixed fire extinguishing system for use within this State:

(@) Must be properly equipped and qualified to perform the service authorized by the type of
license issued;

(b) Must provide a shop or a vehicle as a place of business, properly equipped and subject to
inspection by the [State Fire-Marshal-and-the-adtheritiest authority having jurisdiction; and

(c) If heisengaged in the installation or maintenance of portable fire extinguishers or fixed
fire extinguishing systems, must possess a state contractor’ s license appropriate to the work
performed as issued by the State Contractors Board.

2. Any advertisement that the services of selling, installing, charging or testing or other

maintenance of portable fire extinguishers or fixed fire extinguishing systems are available

--38--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



congtitutes prima facie evidence that the premises, business, building, room or establishment in
or upon which the advertisement appears or to which it refersis a separate location for business.

3. Licensesare classified and defined as follows:

(a) Licensefor apublic agency - Any type of license which isissued to the State or any of its
agencies or political subdivisions for work to be performed by the State or that agency or
political subdivision upon its own properties and for its own use. All requirements set forth in
NAC 477.300 to 477.435, inclusive, except the requirement for a fstate-contracter-sticense}
license issued by the State Contractors' Board, must be met.

(b) Restricted license - A license which authorizes the holder to perform work covered by the
license only upon his own properties and for his own use. All fees must be paid. Unless
otherwise exempted, avalid license issued by the State Contractors’ Board is required.

(c) License- A license which isrequired by NRS 477.033 but isissued to abusinessand is
not restricted.

4. Licensesfor the saleat retail of portable fire extinguishers are issued in two classes, fire
extinguishers required by a code and fire extinguishers not required by any code. Fire
extinguishers required by a code must conform to the standards of the [Natioral-Fire-Pretection
Asseetation} N.F.P.A. and meet the requirements for testing and listing of a nationally
recognized testing laboratory. Fire extinguishers not required by a code must meet the
requirements of the N.F.P.A., be nonrefillable, achieve a minimum of one unit of classification
of rating through testing and listing by a nationally recognized testing |aboratory and be designed
and intended for use in homes, automobiles and recreational vehicles.

Sec. 33. NAC 477.390 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--30--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477.390 1. Inaddition to the requirements set forth in NAC 477.385, any person who
desiresto engage in the installation, maintenance or inspection of an engineered or pre-
engineered fixed extinguishing system must be declared qualified to perform such act or acts by
the State Fire Marshal.

2. The State Fire Marshal will declare a person to be qualified if he provides a certification
from a manufacturer of fixed extinguishing systems that he has received instruction and training

in the installation, maintenance and inspection of fixed extinguishing systems and he passes a

written examination for a certificate of registration. [ta-tieu-of-a-written-examination-the State

Sec. 34. NAC 477.395 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.395 1. Application for alicense or acertificate of registration must be made on forms
prescribed by the State Fire Marshal.

2. Each application must be accompanied by the required fee and contain the following
information:

(@) The name and address of the applicant.

(b) The physical address of the business of the applicant.

(c) Fictitious names used, if any.

(d) Thetype of work performed.

(e) Other pertinent information required by the State Fire Marshal.

--40--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



3. Upon passage of the written examination and any required practical tests or
demonstrations, a certificate of registration endorsed with the type of qualification will be issued
to each qualified person.

4. Information needed to pass the examination on portable fire extinguishersis found in:

(@ N.F.P.A. 10, “Standard for [the tnstaltation,- Maintenance-and-Jse-of} Portable Fire
Extinguishers’; and

(b) NAC 477.380t0 477.435, inclusive . |;-and

» . . ook Eigt h Edition]

5. Information needed to pass the examination on fixed fire extinguishing systemsis found

(8 N.F.P.A. 10" Standardfor-Bry-Chemical-Systems’;

were being-made forthefirsttime] 12, “ Standard on Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing Systems” ;
(b) N.F.P.A. 12A, “ Standard on Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing Systems’;

--41--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) N.F.P.A. 17, “ Standard for Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems”;

(d) N.F.P.A. 17A, “ Standard for Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems’ ; and

(e) N.F.P.A. 2001, “ Standard on Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems.”

Sec. 35. NAC 477.400 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477400 1. Theprovisionsof NAC 477.385 do not prohibit new employees of alicensee
from performing service on portable fire extinguishers for a maximum of 90 days after the
beginning of employment, if the servicing is performed in the presence and under the direct
supervision of aregistrant.

2. A new employee shall not perform service on portable fire extinguishers if, after the
completion of the 90-day period, he fails to pass a written examination and a background
investigation. A conviction of afelony or crime which would demonstrate his lack of good
character isabasisfor denial of a certificate of registration.

3. Within 7 days after employing aregistrant or new employee who performs service on
portable fire extinguishers or fixed fire extinguishing systems, alicensee must report to the State
Fire Marshal the name, address and certificate number of the registrant or the name and address
of the new employee.

4. A licensee shall report any termination of employment by aregistrant within 7 days. A
registrant shall report any change in his address by written notice to the State Fire Marshal

within 7 days after the change.

thecertificate] The State Fire Marshal will issue a new certificate of registration to the
registrant upon receipt of the written notice and the payment of the required fees.

Sec. 36. NAC 477.405 is hereby amended to read as follows:

—-42--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477405 1. No portable fire extinguisher or component of afixed fire extinguishing system
may be sold or leased in this State unless it has been approved, labeled or listed by Underwriters
Laboratories Inc., Underwriters' Laboratories of Canada, [Factory-Mutual-Global-Research
Ceorperation;} FM Global TechnologiesLLC, Applied Research Laboratories, the United States
Coast Guard or any other testing laboratory approved by the State Fire Marshal.

2. No portable fire extinguisher or fixed fire extinguishing system may be sold, leased,
installed or serviced in this State if it uses as an extinguishing agent carbon tetrachloride,
chlorobromomethane, methyl bromide, trichlortrifluoroethane or any other agent which has not
been accepted by alaboratory approved under subsection 1. Any accepted fire extinguishing
agents must be approved by the State Fire Marshal or his authorized representative. Plans for
proposed Halon installations must be submitted to the State Fire Marshal or his authorized
representative with an application for approval. No portable fire extinguisher containing Halon
as an extinguishing agent may be sold or used except as approved by the authority having
jurisdiction for use in commercial occupancies or other special applications.

3. Inverting type extinguishers may not be hydrostatically tested. Each such extinguisher
which becomes due for hydrostatic testing must be permanently removed from service.

4. Each portable fire extinguisher must bear alabel which includes the following
information:

(@ Theunitisafire extinguisher.

(b) The manufacturer’s name.

(c) The date of manufacture.

(d) The designation of the model.

() The numerical rating and classification.

--43--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(f) Theweight full and empty.

(g) The extinguishing agent.

(h) The test pressure determined by the manufacturer.

(i) Thetesting laboratory’slisting label.

(i) Thefreezing limits, if applicable.
= A label bearing thisinformation must not be removed from the extinguisher except when it
has failed to pass the tests or other requirements of this chapter.

Sec. 37. NAC 477.410 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477410 1. All instalation, inspection, maintenance and repair of portable fire
extinguishers and fixed extinguishing systems must be performed in accordance with fthe
standards-ef-thel N.F.P.A. 10, “ Standard for Portable Fire Extinguishers,” 2002 edition, and
the State Fire Marshal.

2. Regardless of exceptions contained in the N.F.P.A.’ s applicable standards |-
—@)-AH}, all portable fire extinguishers except the carbon dioxide extinguishers, disposable
extinguishers and Hal on extinguishers must be recharged at least annually and whenever the
service seal has been broken or an inspection indicates that the extinguisher might fail to
function. For the recharging of any dry chemical type of extinguishment cylinder to be valid, the

serviceman must date and initial [a

with a permanent marking pen on the topmost exposed portion of the pick-up tube before

reassembly and recharging. The date on the pick-up tube must correspond to the date on the

exterior service tag. Failure to date and initial [;-dlate-and-place-an-internal-maintenancetagl the

pick-up tubeis grounds for the immediate suspension or revacation of a certificate of

--44--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



registration. If possible, a collar tag ring asrequired by N.F.P.A. 10 or an alternate collar tag

ring that is approved by the State Fire Marshal must be installed after recharging or servicing

the extinguisher.

3. Nitrogen or approved dry air must be used as expellant when recharging dry chemical

type extinguishers unless the manufacturer recommends otherwise.

--45--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



——6:] Before afire extinguishing system using Halon is accepted, atest as referenced in
N.F.P.A. Standard 11A must be performed and recorded.

FA15.  Within 30 days before the date on which an extinguisher must be serviced, the owner
of a portable fire extinguisher may enter into a verbal service agreement for the service of that
extinguisher. Failure to comply with the provisions of this section by a person who holds a
certificate of registration is a ground for the immediate suspension or revocation of the certificate
of registration, and the person who holds the certificate of registration may be criminally or
civilly liable for fraud.

Sec. 38. NAC 477.415 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477415 1. Each person who performs hydrostatic testing of fire extinguishers
manufactured in accordance with the specifications of the United States Department of
Transportation must do so in accordance with the procedure specified by that Department for
compressed gas cylinders and must have been qualified by atest administered by the State Fire
Marshal and have received the proper license or certificate of registration, or both.

2. The procedure concerning the hydrostatic testing of cylinders listed by the United States
Department of Transportation is set forth in the Compressed Gas Association’ s Pamphlet,
Methods for Hydrostatic Testing of Compressed Gas Cylinders. The 1996 edition of the
pamphlet is hereby adopted by reference. A copy of the pamphlet may be obtained from the
[State Fire- Marshal;} Compressed Gas Association, 4221 Walney Road, 5th Floor, Chantilly,
Virginia 20151-2923, at a price of {$5:50:} $43 for members and $79 for nonmembers.

Sec. 39. NAC 477.420 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.420 A licensee shal replace extinguishers removed from premises for servicing with

spare extinguishers of equal or higher fUL]} ratings during the period the extinguishers being

--46--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



serviced are removed. Failure to comply with the provisions of this section is a ground for the
immediate suspension or revocation of the certificate of registration of the licensee.

Sec. 40. NAC 477.430is hereby amended to read as follows:

477430 1. Theinstaler shall submit evidence of his capability to repair, recharge and
restore fixed fire extinguishing systems within 24 hours after notification of afire or afault in
the system. Theinstaller’ s evidence must include a showing that the installer has:

() The necessary equipment [-astistedin-NAC-477432} and certified personnel for the
service;

(b) The necessary stock of parts, products and devices;

(c) A valid license issued by the State Contractors' Board; and

(d) A certification and approval of a major manufacturer of fixed fire extinguishing systems
which is acceptable to the State Fire Marshal.

2. Where afixed fire extinguishing system is required by a statute, regulation or ordinance,
a satisfactory written agreement for maintenance of the system must be provided. All such
systems must be maintained under the supervision of qualified persons approved by the State
Fire Marshal. A copy of the maintenance agreement along with proof that the firm or company
providing the maintenance is adequately covered by liability insurance must be provided by the
firm or company to the Hecal-fire-department} authority having jurisdiction. A tag conforming to
the requirements of NAC 477.425 must be attached to al such systems. A person certified by the
State Fire Marshal must be present whenever work is performed.

3. Detailed plans of such systems must be submitted to fand-approved-by} the authority
having jurisdiction and must conform to applicable standards and meet the approval of the

authority having jurisdiction. The specifications must require that a puff test of the system be

--47--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



performed by sending a charge of gas through the system to determine the presence of any
obstructions. The test must be certified by the licensee as meeting the requirements of the
National Fire Codes . fand-Standards] That certification must be sent to the authority having
jurisdiction. Plans must be drawn to an indicated scale and must be made so that they can be
easily reproduced. Plans must contain sufficient detail to enable [that} the authority having
jurisdiction to evaluate the effectiveness of the system. Plans must be submitted to and approved
by [that} the authority having jurisdiction before the work starts. Where field conditions
necessitate any substantial change from the approved plan, a corrected plan showing the system
as actually built must be submitted, with the appropriate fee, to fthat} the authority having
jurisdiction for approval. All changes must comply with the codes and standards, and any
substantial change must be submitted to the authority having jurisdiction for review and be
approved by fthat} the authority having jurisdiction before such a change may be made.

4. After afire extinguishing system has been approved and installed, a copy of the system’s
plans must be placed on the premises as required by the authority |-} having jurisdiction. A fire
extinguishing system installed in conformance to the requirements of the National Fire Codes
Fand-Sandards] is not required to be updated to later revisionsin the {Cede} National Fire
Codes until the State Fire Marshal adopts those revisions by reference and the hazard which isto
be protected is remodel ed, removed or substantially altered.

Sec. 41. NAC 477.440 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.440 1. Each portable building in this state must comply with all statutes and
regulations relating to educational facilities or other occupancy classifications, depending on the

intended use of the building.

--48--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. All plansfor the construction and placement of portable buildings must be reviewed and

approved by the

authority having jurisdiction. The fire authority having jurisdiction shall inspect and approve
the placement or relocation of a portable building, including, without limitation, available access
for afire department and water supply, before the building may be occupied.

Sec. 42. NAC 477.441 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477441 1. A new or relocated portable building must:

(@) Beplaced onasurfacewhichis:

(1) Paved or composed of dirt or any other material which is noncombustible; and
(2) Freeof combustible material.

(b) Have askirt that is noncombustible or fire-resistant and which extends from the bottom of
the portable building to ground level.

(c) Have azoneof at least 5 feet that extends outward from the bottom of the skirt and which
isfree of trash, debris, plants or any other combustible material in accordance with section
(2203} 304 of the [Uniform} I nternational Fire Code.

(d) Not be located within 60 feet of a permanent structure, except that a portable building
may be located within 60 feet of a permanent structure if the location of the portable building is
in compliance with section 505} 503.1.3 of the [Unifer} | nternational Building Code.

(e) Have at least two means of egress, as that term is defined by the [Uniferm} | nternational
Building Code.

(f) Provideillumination for each egress.

(g) Beequipped with afire extinguisher which has a minimum rating of 2A-10BC.

--49--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(h) Be provided with afire alarm system, as required by the [Jniferm} I nternational Fire
Code. If the portable building is designated for occupancy as a*“ Group B occupancy used for
educational purposes’ or asa“Group E occupancy,” the portable building must have an
automatic and a manual fire alarm system, which is integrated with the fire alarm system in the
primary building.

2. Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, if two or more portable buildings are
placed next to each other, there must be no empty spaces between the buildings. If it is
physically impossible to place portable buildings next to each other so that there are no spaces
between the portable buildings, the space between the portable buildings must have a barrier to
prevent combustible materials or debris from entering that space.

3. Flammable or combustible material may not be stored beneath a portable building.

4. Portable buildings may not be joined if there are windows or other openings on the joined
wall other than doors that are designed and used as access between the buildings.

5. Portable buildings which abut or are grouped together must not exceed the total area
alowed by the [Uniferm} I nternational Building Code for occupancies which are designated as
[ Type5-nenrated”} “ Type V-B.”

Sec. 43. NAC 477.442 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.442 1. [A} An existing portable building which has fre-windews-er} only one door to
the exterior must be equipped with:

(8) A system for emergency lighting . fas+eguired-by-N-FP-A—Standard-101,-section-30-

(b) Anautomatic fire sprinkler system asrequired by N.F.P.A. Standard {264;section## 13

--50--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(1) The maximum legal occupancy of the building exceeds 50 persons; or
(2) Morethan two portable buildings are joined together to be used for classrooms or
assembly.

2. All other portable buildings must:

(@) Beincompliance with the codes for building, fire and life safety as adopted by this
chapter or by the local authority {5} having jurisdiction, whichever are more restrictive.

(b) Be equipped with afire extinguisher which has a minimum rating of 2A-10BC.

(c) Have an automatic and a manual fire alarm system if:

(1) The maximum legal occupancy of the joined portable buildings exceeds 50 persons; or
(2) Three or more portable buildings are joined together.

(d) Haveall darm signals installed and connected to a main alarm system as required by
N.F.P.A. Standard 72.

(e) If smoke detectors are required, have those detectors interconnected with the fire alarm
system.

(f) If the portable building is used as a classroom or for any other purpose relating to
education, have and maintain plans for fire drills and evacuation, which must be posted as
prescribed by NRS 392.450.

3. No changein the use of a portable building described in subsection 2 may be made until
the proposed change is reviewed and approved by the fteeal-fire} authority having jurisdiction fer
the State-Fire-Marshal} for compliance with the adopted codes or this section.

4. A system for heating, ventilating or air-conditioning which:

(8 Isinaportable building described in subsection 2;

(b) Can circulate more than 2,000 cubic feet of air per minute; and

--51--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) Shuts down automatically,
= must be serviced quarterly. Records of the service must be maintained for 2 years for review
by the Heeal-fire} authority having jurisdiction.

Sec. 44. NAC 477.444 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.444 1. The Hleeal} authority having jurisdiction fmay} will designate the requirements

for fire flow and fassist-in} approve the location of a site for a portable building based on the

proximity and usability of available fire hydrants. {Fherequirements-must-comply-with-section

tsmorestringent] If it is not possible to locate a portable building which isto be used as a

classroom or for any other purpose relating to education in compliance with such requirements,

the school district in which the building isto be placed may apply to the [tecal-fire-department

intent-of-thischapter-} authority having jurisdiction to request an alternative means of

compliance with the requirements.

2. There must be no obstruction between a hydrant and the areas to be protected. Accessto a
hydrant by fire trucks must not be obstructed. If necessary, a hydrant must be turned, moved or
otherwise relocated to allow access to the hydrant by fire trucks.

Sec. 45. NAC 477.445 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.445 The exterior areas around a portable building, including the areas under stairs or
ramps, must be kept free and clear of accumulations of trash, weeds, dead grass, litter or any
other flammable or combustible material, in accordance with the fUniferm} | nternational Fire
Code. Clearances from other buildings, services or hazards must be maintained as required by

the building and fire codes adopted by the State Fire Marshal for all structures and buildings.

--52--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Sec. 46. NAC 477.446 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.446 Access for vehicles must be provided into any area where a portable building is
located. Not less than two means of access which meet the requirements of the Hecal-fire}
authority having jurisdiction or the fdniferm} I nternational Fire Code, whichever is more
stringent, must be provided, except that , if physical difficulties exist, the authority having
jurisdiction may approve a single means of access.

Sec. 47. NAC 477.455 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477455 1. Nocomponent or device of an automatic sprinkler system may be sold, leased
or installed in this State unless it has been approved, labeled or listed by Underwriters
Laboratories |5} Inc., Underwriters Laboratories of Canada, [Factery-Mutual-Glebal-Researeh
Cerperation} FM Global Technologies LLC or other testing laboratory approved by the State
Fire Marshal as qualified to test such a component or device.

2. Automatic sprinkler systems must comply with the fJniferm} | nternational Fire Code
and the following standards of the [Natienal-Fire-Protection-Association:} N.F.P.A.:

(@) Frstalatien] “ Standard for the I nstallation of Sprinkler Systems,” Standard 13.

(b) FooreondbdanicnonsocetSornlderSystoms Stondord L2/

—(e)—Standpipe} “ Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systemsin One- and Two-
Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes,” Standard 13D.

(c) “Standard for the I nstallation of Sprinkler Systemsin Residential Occupancies up to
and Including Four Storiesin Height,” Standard 13R.

(d) “Standard for the I nstallation of Standpipe, Private Hydrants, and Hose Systems,”

Standard 14.

) Water]

--53--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(e) “Standard for Water Spray Fixed Systems for Fire Protection,” Standard 15.
{6} Foam-water]
(f) “Standard for the Installation of Foam-Water Sprinkler and Foam-Water Spray

Systems,” Standard 16.

“ H H ”
h

(g) “Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pumpsfor Fire Protection,” Standard 20.

o) Water]

(h) Standard for Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection,” Standard 22.

(i) “Standard for the I nstallation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances,”
INGFPA-} Standard 24.

(j) “Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire
Protection Systems,” Standard 25.

Sec. 48. NAC 477.460 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477460 1. Eachautomatic fire sprinkler system must be inspected quarterly. One of the
quarterly inspections must be termed an annual inspection and be conducted in accordance with
the provisions of subsection 2. The other quarterly inspections may be conducted by any
responsible person, including an employee of afirm, who, in the opinion of the authority having

jurisdiction, has sufficient knowledge of the system to conduct such inspections. The quarterly

inspections must conform to the requirements of N.F.P.A. Standards 13 and 25 . fand-with-the

LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Records of inspection must be kept on-site for review by the authority having jurisdiction. Any
deficiencies must be reported to the authority having jurisdiction pwithin5-werking-days] if the
owner or occupant hasreceived notice of the deficiency and fails to correct the deficiency
within 30 days. Systems which terminate within a station for central control for a high-rise
building must be scheduled for testing in accordance with paragraph (€) of subsection 2 of NAC
477.283.

2. Theannua inspection must be made by a qualified licensee for automatic fire sprinkler

systems. The annual inspection must comply with the standards and publications described in

subsection 1 . fand-include the following:

--55--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



--56--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



3. If amaintenance inspection indicates that additional work is required on afire sprinkler

system in order to have the system conform to code requirements, the licensee shall notify the

--57--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



owner and the authority having jurisdiction in writing immediately after the inspection. A tag
must be properly signed, punched and attached. The word “ deficient” must be written across the
bottom of the tag.

063 4. A licensed company must give 30 days' written notice to the owner, the occupant
and the authority having jurisdiction before it may discontinue service to the owner or the
occupant, or both.

Sec. 49. NAC 477.465 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477465 1. Thedistributor, installer or agency to provide service to customers must submit
evidence of its capability to repair and restore an automatic sprinkler system within 24 hours
after notification of afire or fault in the system and must repair a system within 24 hours after
being notified by the owner that a system requires service. The evidence of that capability is
subject to approval by the State Fire Marshal. The evidence must demonstrate that the licensee
has:

(a) The necessary equipment and personnel appropriately certified by the State Fire Marshal;

(b) The necessary stock of parts and devices,

(c) A valid license issued by the State Contractors' Board; and

(d) A certification and approval by the manufacturer from whom the equipment is purchased.

2. Where automatic sprinkler systems are installed for any reason, a satisfactory written
agreement for the maintenance of the system must be provided. All systems must be under the
supervision of qualified persons. No work may be performed on an automatic sprinkler system
unless a holder of acertificate of registration is present to supervise the work. Proper tests and
inspections must be made at prescribed intervals, and qualified persons must have general charge

of al alterations and additions to the systems under their supervision. A copy of the agreement

--58--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



for maintenance, along with proof that the firm or company which will provide the maintenance
is adequately covered by liability insurance, must be submitted by the firm or company to the
Heecal-fire-department} authority having jurisdiction.

3. Detailed plans, with the appropriate fees, must be submitted to the [State Fire Marshal-for
approval-and-to-thetoeal} authority having jurisdiction [} for approval. The specifications must
state that the installation will conform to the applicable standards and be approved by the
authority having jurisdiction before the sprinkler system isinstalled. The specifications must
include the specific tests required by the N.F.P.A.’ s standards and the standards required for the
approval of fthat-autherity] the authority having jurisdiction. Plans must be drawn to an
indicated scale or be suitably dimensioned and must be made so that they can be easily
reproduced. Plans must contain sufficient detail to enable [that} the authority having jurisdiction
to evaluate the effectiveness of the system. Plans must be submitted to the [State Fire Marshal
and-thetoeal} authority having jurisdiction before work starts. Where field conditions necessitate
any substantial change from the approved plan, the corrected plan showing the system as
installed, with the appropriate fees, must be submitted to the [State Fire- Marshal-and-thetoeal}
authority having jurisdiction for approval. The [State-Fire-Marshal-and-theteecal} authority
having jurisdiction must inspect and approve any substantial changes before the job is
completed. Plans fwhich-have been-approved-by-the State Fire Marshall must be on the job site
when work is being done pursuant to the plan at that site.

4. Calculations must be established from the applicable design curve for sprinkler systems

asshown in N.F.P.A. Standards 13, 13R, 231 and 231C. [Caledlationsmust-be-computed-from

1 There must be

not less than 10 psi additional water pressure above the system demand.

--59--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



5. All hydrostatic tests of systems and flushing of underground systems must be witnessed
by fthe State-Fire-Marshal-er} arepresentative of the authority having jurisdiction. All portions of
the automatic fire sprinkler system, including the underground service from the gate valve, road
box or check valve to the riser, must be installed, tested and flushed by a company licensed by
the State Fire Marshal to perform this work. A company which holds a current Type G-U license
may provide only the underground services from the gate valve, road box or check valveto the
base of the riser. The company shall provide certification of the contractors’ materials and testing
to the authority having jurisdiction upon the completion of the work. The underground services
provided and the certification to be provided to the authority having jurisdiction must meet the
requirements of NAC 477.340 to [477-356;} 477.349, inclusive, and the standards of the
N.F.P.A. for automatic fire sprinkler systems.

6. Upon completing the installation of an automatic sprinkler system, the licensee shall issue
aletter of certification to the authority having jurisdiction. The letter must certify that the system
has been installed in accordance with the approved plans and all applicable national, state and
local codes. The installer shall properly identify all hydraulically designed automatic sprinkler
systems with a permanently attached placard. The placard must show the location and number of
sprinkler heads and the density of discharge over the designed area.

Sec. 50. NAC 477.490 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477490 1. Plansmust be submitted [-with-the-appropriate fee-to-the State Fire Marshal
and} to the authority having jurisdiction for approval before any system isinstalled or modified.
Plans must contain:

(8 The name of the company installing the system.

(b) The general location and exact address of the job location.

--60--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) A rough plot plan showing water supply and property linesin relation to the installation
site.

(d) Water pressure at the installation site.

(e) A rough floor plan with system coverage indication.

(f) Any additional information required by the [State-Fire- Marshal} authority having
jurisdiction.

2. Theauthority having jurisdiction may require additional plans, documentation of testing
data, engineering specifications and equipment as deemed necessary.

Sec. 51. NAC 477.540 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477540 1. Theauthority having jurisdiction may inspect afire sprinkler system at any
time during itsinstallation. The authority having jurisdiction may witness any tests of the
system. The licensee shall contact the authority having jurisdiction and schedule witnessing of
any required testing, including, without limitation, final acceptance tests.

2. The owner of any fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with this chapter and
N.F.P.A. Standard [£3-B} 13D shall conduct or cause to be conducted an annual test of the
system. The firm that installed the system shall provide the owner with written instructions on
the method of testing it. These instructions must include the location of the inspector’ s test valve,

which must drain to the exterior of the building, the location of the water flow alarm mechanism

and the location of the riser assembly. The [iastalation-and-testing-of-afire sprinkler-system

annual test of the system is the responsibility of the owner of the system.

Sec. 52. NAC 477.560 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--61--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477560 Inal medical facilities, custodial care facilities and restrained care facilities, a
device for detection of the products of combustion, other than by detecting heat, must be
installed pursuant to section 12.3.4.5 of pamphlet 101 in the 1997 edition of the National Fire
Codes, fand-Sandards;} published by the [Natienal-Fire-Protection-Assoetation} N.F.P.A.

Sec. 53. NAC 477.562 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477562 The following requirements apply to child care facilities that require inspection and
a certificate of occupancy to be issued by the [State-Fire-Marshal-or-tecal} authority having
jurisdiction:

1. Plansfor the construction of new facilities or the remodeling of existing facilities must be
submitted to the {Stal

faettity-tstn-Clark-County-Washee Ceunty-er-Carson-City, authority having jurisdiction for

approval before the construction or remodeling begins.

2. Each facility must be inspected for compliance with applicable fire and safety regulations
by the authority having jurisdiction before alicense to operate the facility isissued. The facility
must be inspected annually thereafter and have a current certificate of occupancy issued by the
[State Fire- Marshal-or-tocal-authority—as-appropriate] authority having jurisdiction.

3. Smoke detectors approved by the State Fire Marshal must be installed pursuant to the
table provided in NAC 477.563 according to the manufacturer’ s instructions. In newly
constructed buildings, smoke detectors must receive their primary power from the building’s
wiring, with provision made for the detection of smoke during a power failure. If a smoke
detector powered by a battery is currently installed and it fails, the smoke detector must be
replaced by a smoke detector which receivesiits primary power from the wiring of the building

and has a battery as a backup source of power.

--62--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



4. The number of occupants permitted in afacility must be calculated pursuant to N.F.P.A.
Standard 101, or chapters 449 and 477 of NRS, as appropriate.

5. Smoking is prohibited in any area designated as an “E” occupancy area unless the area
has specifically been designated as a smoking area by the authority having jurisdiction. Where
smoking is allowed, ashtrays must be provided.

6. All stairs must be free of obstacles and stored combustible materials. Handrails with turn-
ins must be provided if there are two or more stepsin any stairway.

7. Bathroom and closet doors must open from the inside without the need for akey or any
special knowledge or effort and must be able to be immediately opened from the outside with the
use of an appropriate device hung or placed above or near the door.

8. Basementsin R-3 occupancies used for child care must have at least two unobstructed
exitswhich lead directly to the outside, one of which must open directly at ground level.

9. Portable fire extinguishers must have a minimum rating of 2A-10BC and must be
mounted pursuant to the requirements of N.F.P.A. Standard 10 or the authority having
jurisdiction.

10. Heaters, fireplaces or other similar devices in rooms used for child care must be
protected from contact with children by a sturdy, honcombustible partition, wire screen or
protective metal guard. No portable heating devices are allowed.

11. All heating equipment and hot water heaters must be enclosed in a manner which
prevents children from coming into contact with them.

12. Child-resistant covers must beinstalled on al electrical outlets accessible to children.

13. Wastebaskets, garbage cans and other containers used to store garbage, waste, rubbish

and other combustible materials must be constructed of noncombustible materials and have a

--63--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



tight-fitting lid of the same material. Wastebaskets or other trash containers placed in the
designated smoking areas must be constructed of noncombustible materials with atight-fitting
lid of the same material.

14. No more than 10 gallons of flammable liquid may be stored in any area designated as an
“E” area. This flammable liquid must be stored in an approved metal container and out of the
reach of children.

15. Roomsin which equipment is used or where flammable liquids, combustible dust or
similar hazardous materials are handled must be separated from other portions of the building by
amaterial which has arating of at least 1-hour fire [resistant-cecupanecy-separation} barrier and

must conform to the requirements of the fJriferm-ire} | nternational Building Code.

Sec. 54. NAC 477.563 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.563 The buildings used for child care facilities must be classified pursuant to the model

codes approved by the State Fire Marshal . fand-the follewing-chart:

Family Care Group Care Institutional Child Care
R3 E3 1-3 1-2
Number-of Clients 0-6(SeeNote #3) 7-or-More 6-or-More B6-or-more
Number-of-Chents
Ll Sl e e Sorne S S
Recommended-Staff
Ocecupant-Load
Factor One person/35ft 2 One person/35ft 2 One person/8o-ft 2 One person/8o-ft 2
Areaof Refuge Not-Reguired Not-Reguired Required Reguired
Number of Exits One Fwo Fwo Fwo
Travel Distance to
R ] H-aroem) H-aroom) ]
Exit Discharge To Outside OneDirectly OneDirectly One Directly
b e b
b e
e b e e
Fromtnside From-nside From-nside From-ndde
Protection from
Vertical-Openings PerUBC PerUBC PerUBC PerUBC
B e
--64--

LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



) Sep—{See Note #3) Sep—{See Note #3) Sep—{See Note #3) Sep—{See Note #3)
Class of-Interior
Finish Class Ht Class - Class - Class -
e e ke
e R R
ke e

Sec. 55. NAC 477.566 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477566 Devicesfor the detection of the products of combustion, other than heat, must be
installed in every building which is used for the care of children. The devices must beinstalled in
accordance with [sections-310.9-16-310.9.1.5,inclusive;} section 907.2.10 of the [Uniform}

I nternational Building Code, and N.F.P.A. Standard {16} 72 if so required by the Hecal}
authority having jurisdiction.

Sec. 56. NAC 477.568 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.568 Child care facilities which are used for child care between the hours of 12:00 am.
and 6:00 am. and care for seven or more children must have a sprinkler system installed which
conformsto N.F.P.A. Standard 13, 13D or 13R, as applicable, and the requirements of the
FIniferm} I nternational Building Code. The sprinkler system must be tied into the fire alarm
system so that activation of any portion of the sprinkler system will activate the alarm system.

Sec. 57. NAC 477.576 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--65--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477576 “Commercial display” of fireworks means an fentertainment] event or function
where the public or a private group is admitted or permitted 5} to view the display or discharge
of fdangeroust fireworks.

Sec. 58. NAC 477.606 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.606 No person may engage in the business of producing commercial displays of
fireworks without possessing a license issued by the State Fire Marshal. Conducting commercial
displays of fireworks includes the display or discharge of fdangeroust fireworks at an
entertainment before the public or a private group which has been admitted or permitted to view
the display.

Sec. 59. NAC 477.616 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477616 1. Licenseswill beissued to companiesin one of the following categories:

(8 A generadl license permits the licensee to produce commercia displays of fireworksin one
of the following categories:

(1) Indoor stage;
(2) Outdoor aerial;
(3) Speciad effects; or
(4) Show specific.
= A general licenseisvalid until June 30 following its date of issue.

(b) A limited event license permits a nonprofit organization to produce a specific display of
fireworks or series of displays at the time or times and location specified by the license subject to
local requirements for a permit. A limited licenseisvalid for the single event or series of events

which it specifies.

--66--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) A nonprofit organization must obtain alimited event license (exempt) for a Fourth of July

event. The license will be issued without payment of a fee. The nonprofit organization must:

(1) Show evidence of valid insurance which covers the event or series of events;

(2) Requirethat all persons who participate in producing the display or series of displays
complete the prescribed training program provided by the State Fire Marshal; and

(3) Obtain acertificate of registration for the person who will be responsible for the show
and the safety of the participants and spectators.

2. A licenseissued in one of these categories does not permit the licensee to engage in
activities permitted by another, more general, category.

3. Inproducing acommercial display of fireworks alicensee must:

(@) Obtain any permit or permits required by local authority; and

(b) Employ only pyrotechnic operators who are registered with the State Fire Marshal to
conduct the display or discharge of the fdangerous] fireworks.

Sec. 60. NAC 477.624 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.624 Before aperson may act as a pyrotechnic operator, the person must obtain a
certificate of registration as a pyrotechnic operator from the State Fire Marshal. To receive a
certificate of registration as a pyrotechnic operator, an applicant must:

1. Beanatura person whoisat least 21 years of age;

2. Makeawritten application for such a certificate of registration to the State Fire Marshal
on aform provided by the State Fire Marshal and pay afee of $55;

3. Hold acertificate of registration as an assistant pyrotechnic operator issued by the State
Fire Marshal, or be licensed or certified in good standing as a pyrotechnic operator by another

state, as approved by the State Fire Marshal;

--67--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



4. |If the applicant holds a certificate of registration as an assistant pyrotechnic operator,
pass, with a score of at least 80 percent, afinal examination that covers the design, construction,
storage and use of fdangereus] fireworks; and

5. Submit to the State Fire Marshal:

(@ A log which demonstrates that the applicant has worked on at least 15 different shows
during the 3 years immediately preceding the date on which he applies for the certificate of
registration as a pyrotechnic operator; and

(b) Letters of endorsement from three persons who hold certificates of registration asa
pyrotechnic operator issued by the State Fire Marshal, or are licensed or certified asa
pyrotechnic operator in good standing by another state.

Sec. 61. NAC 477.626 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.626 No person may purchase pyrotechnics for the purposes of commercial display or
prepare, handle, detonate, display or discharge fdangerous] fireworks or special effects without
having first obtained avalid certificate of registration as a pyrotechnic operator for indoor stage,
outdoor aerial, specia effects or show specific. An assistant to a certified pyrotechnic operator
must be under the supervision of the certified pyrotechnic operator.

Sec. 62. NAC 477.636 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477636 1. Certificates of registration for pyrotechnic operators will be issued to
successful applicants. Such a certificate of registration permits the registrant to handle, supervise
and discharge fdangerous} fireworks and special effects at events held for entertainment whether
or not before alive audience. The certificate of registration will be issued for outdoor aerial
display, indoor stage, specia effects or show specific. Any person igniting felangeroust fireworks

must be at least 21 years of age.

--68--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. A certificate of registration for indoor stage or special effects permits the registrant to
handle, supervise and discharge special effects for the purpose of recording the result on film or
videotape or for producing a sound effect where no audience is present other than incidental
spectators. A registrant in this category may handle, supervise or discharge any class of
fireworks if the production of afilm or videotape requires their use.

3. A certificate of registration issued pursuant to this section isvalid until June 30 following
its date of issue.

Sec. 63. NAC 477.641 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477641 1. A licensee or registrant who wishesto renew his license or certificate must do
so between April 1 and June 1, inclusive.

2. Feesfor therenewal of acertificate of registration are as follows:

Assistant PyroteChNiC OPEIaLOr .........ccuvveueirerieerisieeeesisieese st ssesese e sese e sesens $27.50
FgTe (o 0] g 7o =TSSP 55.00
OULAOOT BEFTEL ...ttt bbb e e 55.00
S o 1c ot = = £ 55.00
ShOW SPECITIC ...ttt eb et sa e ere e 55.00
V=" [T oI T o TSP RRSPRSTPRTSTURPRON 27.50
FIFE PEITOINMEY ..ottt et b e 27.50
Duplicate certificate of registration or change of address.........c.ccocvvvvvievvcivceeceeneene 11.00

3. Torenew acertificate of registration, the holder of the certificate of registration must, for
each classification sought to be renewed, have logged the following number of events or
performances during the previous 12 months:

(O 010 (o0 gF=" ¢ - USSR At least one performance

--69--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



[NOOO SLAGE......v ettt e e At least five performances
SpeCial EffECtS....ooiicicire e At least three performances
SNOW SPECITIC ... s Atleast 10 performanceﬁ*

Sec. 64. NAC 477.646 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.646 1. The State Fire Marsha may suspend, revoke or refuse to renew alicense for
commercial displays of fireworks or a certificate of a pyrotechnic operator if the licensee or
registrant has caused injuries or permitted afire hazard at alocation at which he:

(@) Stores, handles or prepares fireworks, specia effects or pyrotechnic devices; or

(b) Produces or conducts acommercial display of fireworks or specia effects.

2. If anincident results from afire hazard caused or permitted by alicensee or registrant, he
shall immediately submit to the State Fire Marshal areport explaining the incident. The failure to
make this report is grounds for immediate revocation of the license or certificate.

3. A person whose license or certificate has been revoked must dispose of the fireworks,
special effects or pyrotechnic devices in his possession within 10 days after receiving written
notice to do so by the State Fire Marshal. In complying with this subsection, the licensee or
registrant shall transfer the fireworks, special effects or pyrotechnic devices only to a person who
islicensed to produce commercial displays of fireworks or who is otherwise permitted to
lawfully purchase and possess fdangerous} fireworks or pyrotechnic devices. Upon the transfer
of the fireworks, special effects or pyrotechnic devices, the licensee or registrant shall submit a
written report to the State Fire Marshal which includes the name, license number, address and
telephone number of the person to whom the fireworks, special effects or pyrotechnic devices
were transferred.

Sec. 65. NAC 477.661 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--70--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04

__ - | Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.5", First

line: 0", Tabs: 6.5", Right,Leader: ...




477.661 1. No person may:

(@) Useor discharge:

(1) A specia effect or fdangereus] firework unless he is a pyrotechnic operator certified
by the State Fire Marshal.

(2) A firework of any class or type within 100 feet of stored gasoline or other flammable
liquid which islisted as Class | in N.F.P.A. Standard 30 or any other combustible material.

(b) Display or discharge afdangereus] firework at acommercial display of fireworksin such
amanner as to endanger any person.

(c) Discharge fireworks of any classin a county where the discharge of the fireworksis
prohibited.

2. If the [State Fire- Marshal-or} authority having jurisdiction believes that fireworks which
create an imminent danger to life or property will be discharged in violation of this subsection,
the [State-Fire-Marshal-or} authority having jurisdiction may seize the fireworks without notice.

3. The[StateFire-Marshal-or-tocal} authority having jurisdiction will take and retain
possession of fireworks seized in accordance with this section during any judicial or
administrative proceedings involving the fireworks and will, upon conclusion of the proceedings,
destroy them or return them to the person from whom they were seized as directed in such
proceedings.

4. Any person whose fireworks are adjudged in any judicia or administrative proceeding to
be hazardous will be charged with the expenses incurred in the seizure, transportation, storage
and disposal of those fireworks. This charge constitutes a debt and is collectible by any agency
of the State or any of its political subdivisionsincurring any such expense in the same manner as

if it isan obligation under an express or implied contract.

--71--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



Sec. 66. NAC 477.663 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.663 1. No person may maintain or permit the existence of afire hazard at any location
under his control where fireworks or pyrotechnic compositions are displayed, discharged or
stored.

2. A permit issued by the State Fire Marshal isrequired for the storage of fireworks
classified as fClass B Divisien1.3-er Class C-Division-1-4;} Division 1.3G, Division 1.4G or
Division 1.14S by 18 U.S.C. 8§88 841 et seq. and N.F.P.A . |} Standard 1124, except for:

(a) Fireworks classified as consumer [fireworks-which-are-net-dangerous fireworks-and
whieh} fireworks that are stored at fan} a retail outlet for fsalesatretait} sale as approved by the
State Fire Marshal or pursuant to a permit issued by the State Fire Marshal after an inspection of
the siteis made;

(b) Fireworksfor public display or special effects stored at the site of firing for immediate
use; and

(c) Storage of material for special effects which weighs less than 10 pounds.

3. Feesfor permitsfor storage are as follows:

__ - 7| Formatted: Tabs: 0.2", Left +

(@) A building for permanent or temPOrary StOFAGE ..........c.eveeveueeeereerererresseesesesssseesssenens $220° 6.5, Right,Leader: ..
(D) TYPE L MAGAZINE......eeueeueeeeeeesesiestese sttt e s et ees e e e e teseestestessessesseesesseeneeseeneensensensens 220
(C) TYPE 2, 30F 4 MAYAZINE ...eevevereeetesiesieeterteeeeseeseeaeaesees e ssessestessessessesneeseeseensensessensensessens 110

4. Fireworks must be stored in compliance with the requirements of the [Sniferm}
I nternational Building Code and Standard 1124 of the National Fire Codes fand-Standarés} of
the N.F.P.A. Material for special effects which weighs less than 750 pounds may be stored in a
single-story structure which is fully equipped with fire sprinklers and which otherwise conforms

to the requirements for a Type f\5-2-heur] V-A rated building as described in the fUniform}

_72--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



I nternational Building Code. Material for specia effects which weighs 750 pounds or more
must be stored in a magazine approved for that purpose.

5. The State Fire Marshal will, as he determines necessary, inspect each site used for storage
of fireworksto determineif the fireworks are stored properly according to their class or type.

Sec. 67. NAC 477.666 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477666 1. Fireworksstoredin violation of NAC 477.601 to 477.666, inclusive, which
have become chemically unstable or which are in the possession of a person who isnot a
licensee or registrant or whose license or certificate has been suspended are hereby declared to
be fire hazards and may be seized and disposed of by the [State-Fire-Marshal-or-atoea
adtherity-} authority having jurisdiction. Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, the
seizure may take place only after reasonable advance written notice is given to the holder of the
permit who stores the fireworks unless there exists an imminent threat of danger to life or
property. If such athreat exists, those fireworks which create an imminent threat of danger to life
or property may be seized without notice by the [State-Fire-M-arshal-or} authority having
jurisdiction.

2. The officer seizing the fireworks must promptly report to the State Fire Marsha
concerning:

(@) The quantity and type of the fireworks seized;

(b) The location where the seizure occurred;

(c) The circumstances prompting the seizure; and

(d) The condition of the containers and fireworks seized. Fireworks that are found to be

unstable or incompatible must be destroyed.

--73--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



3. The[State Fire-Marshal-or-tocal} authority having jurisdiction will take and retain

possession of the seized fireworks during any judicial or administrative proceedings involving
the fireworks and will, upon conclusion of the proceedings, destroy them or return them to the
person from whom they were seized as directed in such proceedings.

4. Any person whose fireworks are adjudged in any judicial or administrative proceeding to
be hazardous will be charged with the expenses incurred in the seizure, transportation, storage
and disposal of those fireworks. This charge constitutes a debt and is collectible by any agency
of the State or any of its political subdivisionsincurring any such expense in the same manner as
if it isan obligation under an express or implied contract.

5. Fireworks transported in violation of any applicable federal or state law or regulation will
be seized and impounded. The explosive load of any impounded firework must not be separated
unless necessary to remove unstable or incompatible materials. Materials that are found to be
unstable or incompatible will be destroyed at the expense of the owner or possessor, or both.

Sec. 68. NAC 477.680 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.680 No person may sell or offer for sale any plastic or other nonmetallic portable
container for use in storage or transportation of Class| or Class |1 flammable or combustible

liquids.

Sec. 69. NAC 477.710 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477710 1. Except as provided in subsection 3, no person may use explosivesin blasting
operations for commercial construction unless he has a certificate of registration for blasting
issued by the State Fire Marshal or is under the direct supervision of a person holding such a

certificate. An applicant for a certificate of registration for blasting must:

(8) [Beatteast2lyearsotage;

--74--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



—h)} Meet the criteria outlined in section 3301.4 of the I nternational Fire Code;

(b) Passa background check;

(c) Passawritten, oral or other type of examination, as determined by the State Fire Marshal;
and

Hh} (d) Pay afeeof $55 at the time he submits his application.

2. The certificate of registration for blasting must be in the possession of the registrant while
he is performing blasting operations. A registrant must pay afee of $11 for aduplicate of a
certificate that has been lost or destroyed.

3. Thissection does not apply to the use of pyrotechnics governed by other provisions of
this chapter or the use of explosives:

() By aperson engaged in agriculture or ranching for occasional use on his property;

(b) By an employee of the State, alocal government or the Federal Government who uses

explosives for construction in the proper performance of his duties; or

--75--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(c) Ingasoline, in fertilizer and in tools or other devices which are actuated by a propellant.

4. A certificate of registration for blasting must be renewed every [5} 2 years. An applicant
for renewal must pass atest prescribed by the State Fire Marshal and pay afee of $55 before his
certificate of registration for blasting may be renewed.

Sec. 70. NAC 477.770 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477770 1. A license must be obtained from the State Fire Marshal to service and clean
Type 1 exhaust system grease ducts. A Type 1 exhaust system grease duct has the meaning
ascribed to it in the National Fire Codes . fand-Standards}

2. Toobtain alicense to service and clean a Type 1 exhaust system grease duct an applicant
must:

(@) Pass an examination administered by the State Fire Marshal; and

(b) Establish that he has read and understands N.F.P.A. Standard 96, section [8-3} 11.4 and is
properly equipped to service and clean Type 1 exhaust system grease ducts.

3. A licensee who has obtained a license from the State Fire Marshal to service and clean
Type 1 exhaust system grease ducts must also be licensed to do businessin the city or county in
which it is providing this service.

4. Employees of the licensee who are not licensed may be allowed to assist in the servicing
and cleaning of Type 1 exhaust systems if a person certified by the State Fire Marshal is on the
premises at al times and the certificate of inspection and maintenance isfilled out by that
certified person who will accept responsibility for the work.

Sec. 71. NAC 477.780 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--76--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477.780 1. A copy of the cleaning contract and cleaning reports for a Type 1 exhaust
system must be maintained at the site where the exhaust system is located and made available to
the authority having jurisdiction upon request.

2. Within 30 days after inspecting or cleaning a Type 1 exhaust system, a copy of areport
describing any deficiencies found in the system or a notice that service was refused or was
extended beyond the limitations of the contract must be sent to the authority having jurisdiction.
A report describing any deficiencies must specify all deficiencies that were not corrected during
the servicing of the system, including, but not limited to:

() Excessive grease;

(b) Inaccessible areas;

(c) Access panels which do not comply fte} with code specifications;

(d) Fansthat are not commercial or cleanable; and

(e) Missingfilters.
= The report must be signed by a person representing the owner of the system.

3. When grease or other residues are present within the hood, ducts or devices for the
removal of grease, the system must be cleaned in accordance with N.F.P.A. [section-96-8-3}
Standard 96, section 11.4.

Sec. 72. NAC 477.810 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.810 1. Firestandpipe systems must be inspected annually by a person certified by the
State Fire Marshal for fire standpipe systems who works for afirm licensed by the State Fire
Marshal to service fire standpipe systems. The annual inspection must conform to the

requirements of the “Fire Protection Systems Inspection, Test and Maintenance Manual,” as

--77--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



published by the [Na

Code] N.F.PA.

2. A copy of the annual inspection report must be maintained on-site and sent to the owner.
A report describing any deficiencies found during the annual inspection must be sent to the
authority having jurisdiction if the owner failsto correct the deficiency within 10 days after the
inspection.

3. Before hydrostatic tests may be conducted on afire standpipe system, the installer of the
fire standpipe system must notify the authority having jurisdiction in such a manner asto provide
the authority having jurisdiction with sufficient time to schedule an appointment so that the
authority having jurisdiction can be present when the hydrostatic tests are conducted on the fire
standpipe system. Tests must be certified by the licensee as meeting code requirements and a
copy of that certification must be maintained fen-side} on-site. A copy of areport describing
any deficienciesin the systems found during the testing must be sent to the authority having
jurisdiction.

4, Theinstaller of afire standpipe system shall place ametal tag on the control valve for the
system which states the name of the installing company and the date of the installation.

5. Any work done on the system must be done under the supervision of a person who has a
certificate of registration for that work. At the conclusion of the service, test, inspection or
installation, the person holding a certificate of registration shall sign and place an approved tag
on the system control riser. The tag must be punched in an approved manner to indicate the type
of service performed on the system and the date it was performed.

Sec. 73. NAC 477.830 is hereby amended to read as follows:

--78--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



477830 1. Beforeinstalling or remodeling afire standpipe system, the owner of the
system shall submit to the authority having jurisdiction:

(a) Design specifications for the system;

(b) A list of materialsto be used in the system;

(c) Scale drawings of the remaodeling or installation which:

(1) Can beeasily reproduced; and
(2) Areof sufficient detail to enable the authority having jurisdiction to evaluate the
effectiveness of the system;

(d) A schedule of tests required by the appropriate code; and

(e) Caculationsfor the flow of water for the proposed system.

2. When substantial change has been made in the plans approved by the [State Fire- Marshal
erthe} authority having jurisdiction for the construction or remodeling of the system, a corrected
plan depicting the system as it was built must be submitted, with the appropriate fees, to the
[StateFire-Marshal-erautherity-as-apprepriate;} authority having jurisdiction for approval
within 10 days after the completion of the system.

3. Theresults of hydrostatic tests of the system must be certified to the authority having
jurisdiction and the owner in writing.

Sec. 74. NAC 477.840 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.840 1. Following the installation of afire standpipe system, the licensee shall submit a
letter to the authority having jurisdiction certifying that the system has been installed in
accordance with the plans approved by the authority having jurisdiction and al applicable state

and local codes.

--79--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Within 30 days after completing the installation or remodeling of a fire standpipe system,
the licensee shall attach a metal placard which must:

(a) Identify al requirements for the hydraulic design.

(b) The number, size and location of system outlets and the calculated discharge of the
highest outlet.

Sec. 75. NAC 477.850 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.850 1. A tagfor recording the installation, maintenance and inspection of fire
standpipe systems must be at least 4 inches long, 2 inches wide and conform to the requirements
of NAC 477.470.

2. Thetag must serve asaseal for theriser control valve and must be attached in such a
manner that the valve cannot be closed without removing the tag.

3. Theholder of a certificate of registration who is supervising the work on a system must
be present at all times that work is being done on the system and must sign, date and punch the
tag and attach it to the system immediately at the conclusion of testing or completion of the
installation. If the system remains deficient and the licensee does not have the authority to
correct the deficiency, the word “ deficient” must be written across the bottom of the tag. The
licensee shall notify the owner and the authority having jurisdiction of the deficiency in writing
within 5 days after completing the work.

Sec. 76. NAC 477.910 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.910 1. Every new building constructed by or for the State of Nevada must meet or
exceed the minimum requirements of this chapter and the codes adopted by the State Fire

Marshal.

--80--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Every new building owned fer-ececupied] by the State that isintended for occupancy

477915} must be equipped with an automatic fire suppression system. Rooms in such a new
building which are to be used for sleeping purposes must be equipped with smoke detectors. The
smoke detectors must receive their primary power from the building’ s wiring, with provision
made for the detection of smoke during a power failure.
3. A person who removes or disables any smoke detector required by this section is subject
to prosecution for a misdemeanor in accordance with NRS 477.250.
Sec. 77. NAC 477.915 is hereby amended to read as follows:
477915 1. Every existing building owned for-eceupied] by the State of Nevada must:
(@ Comply with the provisions of NRS 477.100 to 477.170, inclusive;
(b) Meet the requirements of the building code in effect when the building was constructed;
(c) If the building:
(1) Isdesignated asaB occupancy;
(2) [Has} Regardiess of occupancy designation, has afloor area which exceeds 12,000
sguare feet on any floor or 24,000 square feet on al floors, including any mezzanines; or
(3) Isan R-1 or R-2 occupancy,
= be scheduled for installation of an automatic fire suppression system during the next
remodeling of or addition to the building ; [afterJuby-1,-1995:1
(d) Meet the requirements for fire flows contained in this chapter and the fUniferm}
I nternational Fire Code, [£997} 2003 edition; and

(e) Be equipped with noncombustible containers for the disposal of smoking materialsin

designated smoking areas.

--81--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Every firein abuilding or area of a building owned fer-eecupied] by the State must be
reported to the local fire department immediately and to the State Fire Marshal within 24 hours.
The report must be filed by the state agency affected with the Nevada State Fire Marshal, 107
Jacobsen Way, Carson City, Nevada 89711.

3. Upon the failure of a smoke detector which is powered by a battery and installed in a
building owned or occupied by the State , fbefereFebruary-17-1994.} the smoke detector must
be replaced by a smoke detector which is connected to the wiring of the building and has a
battery as a backup source of power.

4. A person who knowingly violates the provisions of this section is subject to prosecution
for a misdemeanor in accordance with NRS 477.250.

Sec. 78. NAC 477.920 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.920 1. Unlessotherwise required by state feodetocal-code} statute or regulation or
local ordinance, anew commercial building that has more than 5,000 square feet of floor space
must be equipped with an automatic fire suppression system if:

(@ The community or area where the building islocated is not served by a water system or
utility and cannot produce the required fire flow;

(b) The community or areais not served by an organized fire department that is capable of
responding to the report of an alarm at the building within 10 minutes; or

(c) Thebuilding is not served by an all-weather access road.

2. Anincrease in floor space areathat is allowed by section {962.2.2.2} 503 of the {2997}
2003 edition of the [Uniferm} I nternational Building Code must be approved by the authority
having jurisdiction when a system isinstalled in compliance with this section.

3. Asusedin this section:

--82--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(a) “Organized fire department” means a fire department that is capable of producing afire
flow of not less than 500 gallons per minute for 30 minutes using pumper tanker operations.

(b) “All-weather accessroad” has the meaning ascribed to it in section {962} 503.2.3 of the
FIniferm] I nternational Fire Code.

Sec. 79. NAC477.015, 477.350, 477.355, 477.360, 477.432, 477.443, 477.581, 477.586,

477.685, 477.760 and 477.800 are hereby repealed.

TEXT OF REPEALED SECTIONS

477.015 “Administrator” defined. “Administrator” means the executive officer of a
political subdivision.

477.350 Approval of equipment; compliance with standards; smoke detectors. (NRS
477.030)

1. Nofiresystem, device or component of any fire system may be sold, leased or installed in
this state unless it is approved, labeled or listed by Underwriters Laboratories Inc., Underwriters
Laboratories of Canada, Factory Mutual Research Global Corporation or any other testing
laboratory approved by the State Fire Marshal as being qualified to test such systems or devices
or if an approved listing from atesting laboratory is not available for a system, device or a

--83--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



component, by the State Fire Marshal on the basis of a practical test or examination and payment
of the required fee by the person who is requesting approval of the system, device or component
by the State Fire Marshal.

2. Inaddition to other provisions of NAC 477.340 to 477.370, inclusive, fire systems must
comply with standards published by the N.F.P.A. and the International Conference of Building
Officials.

3. Where smoke detectors are required by any statute, regulation or ordinance, evidence of
approval must be furnished to the purchaser at the time of purchase or delivery. The evidence
must be alisting or label from one of the approved laboratories.

4. All new structures built for residential purposes which are not otherwise required by any
statute, regulation or ordinance to be equipped with smoke detectors or other fire systems must
be equipped with smoke detectors that have been approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

477.355 Combination paging alarm systems: Equipment. (NRS 477.030)

1. Cone-type and horn-type loudspeakers and line matching transformers employed in
combination paging alarm systems must meet or exceed the following requirements:

(8 Thehorn or loudspeaker must be rated at a minimum wattage to provide the coverage
specified in subsection 1 of NAC 477.360.

(b) The matching transformer must be rated at a minimum of twice the wattage required for
the load for the speaker as specified in subsection 1 of NAC 477.360.

(c) Therating for aloudspeaker must be calculated for the speaker as actually installed and
used, with the backbox, grille and matching transformer attached.

(d) A speaker must be housed in ametal backbox specifically designed for loudspeakers or

other approved electrical box.

--84--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(e) Where applicable, the speaker must be located near the initiating device.

(f) Where enclosures for speakers are permitted to be mounted on the surface for two-way or
one-way projection, they must provide protection to the speaker. Tamperproof mounting is
required.

(g) Any areawhere environmental conditions are detrimental to cone-type speakers must be
provided with horn-type loudspeakers mounted flush on the surface which meet the minimum
reguirements for a cone-type speaker.

(h) Each deeping room on protected premises must be equipped with aloudspeaker.

(i) Any device to sound an alarm must be listed by Underwriters Laboratories Inc. for use as
afireaarm.

(i) The engineer who designs the system shall ensure that the equipment for the alarm meets
the minimum standards set forth in this section and NAC 477.350 and 477.360.

(k) Thearchitect or designer shall ensure that the number and placement of loudspeakers
meets the requirements of subsection 1 of NAC 477.360.

2. Thedevicesto generate and amplify signals and the equipment to supervise their
operation in a combination paging aarm system must meet current standards of the National Fire
Protection Association and the following requirements:

(@ Amplifiers, tone generators and associated equipment must be installed to provide a
completely independent operating system. Each system must include a “fail-safe” panel which
will monitor the sound system against open and short circuits, grounds, mechanical damage and
loss of power in all components while equipment isin use or on standby. Power amplifiers and

signal generators must be designed with solid-state circuitry and be tested and approved for use

--85--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



asfire darms by arecognized testing laboratory, an agency approved by the State Fire Marshal,
or both.

(b) The tone generator must emit a unique tone distinctive in sound and oscillation which will
awaken a sleeping person.

(c) When the supervisory panel has detected afault, it must emit an audible and visual signal.
These signals must be indicated at all annunciator panels and at central control. Trouble signals
must include a switch for silencing the audio trouble signal. Visual trouble signals must not be
cancelled until the fault is corrected.

3. Each combination paging alarm system must include a central station for control with the
following features:

(@) The station must have accessto all systems of vocal communications, panels for manual
and automatic fire alarms, status indicators for elevators and systems for handling air, controls
for unlocking stairwell doors, a public telephone with a direct outside line, indicators for valves
for sprinklers and the flow of water and standby controls.

(b) All metalware of any cabinets or panels must have been manufactured by a company
regularly engaged in the manufacture of enclosures for electrical or electronic apparatus.

(c) Switching and annunciator panels must be segmented in groups of switches with each
separate group clearly marked to identify the systems it controls.

477.360 Combination paging alarm systems: Design.

1. Areasto be protected by a combination paging alarm system must be covered with

sufficient loudspeakersto achieve at least 80 decibels of sound at any place within the protected

property.

--86--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



2. Thecentra control panel for the combination paging alarm system and the annunciator
panel must consist of switches, with one switch for the speakers in each zone. Zoning of the
protected property must be approved by the State Fire Marshal or the local fire department. The
system must be capable of selective vocal transmission to any zone by the use of one or more
switches. One switch must be provided for calling al zones.

3. Thecentral control panel must include a power supply and associated equipment and
circuitry for a system of communication by telephone, and a handset must be located at the
panel. This requirement may be satisfied by installing an internal telephone system, complete
with handsets at indicated locations, or installing jacks at the indicated locations, and having
portable handsets stored at the central station for control.

4. A paging microphone must be provided at each annunciator panel and the central control
panel. Keying the button on the paging microphone must mute all fire alarm signals, and the fire
alarm function must be automatically restored when the microphoneisnot in use. The
microphone at the central control panel must be capable of overriding all audible fire signals.

5. The capability for giving a general alarm must be available by manual switches at the
annunciator panels and the central control panel. The use of asignal from other manual stations
to the management before a general alarm is sounded is permitted if the management has an
emergency procedure which is approved by the State Fire Marshal or the local fire department.
The system for those signals must be interconnected to an approved central station for receiving
signals where such services are available.

6. Anannunciator panel must be provided at the central station for control. Additional

annunciator panels must be provided if required by the local authority.

--87--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



7. Any other annunciator panel must be of the same design as the central control panel.
Access to the fire department’ s control panel must be by a common lock and key which is
acceptable to that department.

8. Keying amicrophone at the central control panel or any other annunciator panel must
automatically silence the monitor speakers at that location.

9. All components of the system must be continuously supervised and annunciated on al
panels.

10. When requested to do so by the fire department, the owner shall:

(a) Perform tests on the premises to demonstrate the operation of the system and its
compliance with the audio coverage specified in this section; or

(b) Provide an engineer’s certification as to such performance and compliance.

11. Anactual test of the system isrequired once each month. All equipment must be
maintained in proper operating condition.

12.  Where cross-ventilation is not possible because of the design of the building or the
system for handling air, controls for the gjection of smoke must be provided at the central control
panel and any other panel, including:

(@ An on-off control for the supply of air;

(b) An on-off control for the exhaust; and

(c) A control to shut down the override portion of the system for automatic detection.

477.432 Servicing and repairs: Required equipment, toolsand materials. (NRS
477.030)

1. Thefollowing equipment must be located in a shop used to service fire extinguishers and

fixed fire extinguishing systems:

--88--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(a) Either:
(1) A dry air compressor with a moisture monitor and pressurizing station;
(2) A dry nitrogen supply and pressurizing station;
(3) A carbon dioxide supply and fill station; or
(4) A Halon supply and fill station,
= depending upon the type of license issued to the licensee.
(b) Transfer pumps, as appropriate.
(c) Work benches.
(d) Cylinder racks, as appropriate.
(e) A chainhoist and trolley, as appropriate.
(f) A dry chemicdl fill station with an approved exhaust and collection system.
(g) A shop vacuum.
(h) One hundred and 500-pound beam scales which must be calibrated annually.
(i) Balance scales.
(i) Low pressure hydrostatic test equipment, as appropriate.
(k) A cylinder dryer.
(1) Internal cylinder cleaning equipment.
(m) Test cages, as appropriate.
(n) A cylinder vise and bench.
(o) A chain or pipevise.
(p) Regulators.
(q) A devicefor purging cylinders.

(r) Gaugeswhich must be calibrated annually.

--89--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(s) A system for keeping records which must be available for inspection.

(t) Power drills and bench grinders.

(u) Approved service tags and internal tags.

2. Therepair shop and the vehicle used to travel to locations where repairs are to be made
must include the following inspection equipment:

() A measuring tape.

(b) A penlight.

(c) Extension mirrors.

(d) Aninternal inspection light.

(e) Torquewrenches.

(f) A thread-size gauge.

(g) A scalewhichisable to measure weights up to 50 pounds and which is calibrated
annually.

(h) A 4-pound by 1-ounce cartridge scale.

(i) A gauge which can measure air pressure to a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square
inch.

3. Therepair shop and the vehicle used to travel to locations where repairs are to be made
must include the following tools:

(a) Assorted recharge adapters.

(b) Tapsand dies.

(c) Pipeand screw extractors.

(d) Wireand nylon bristle brushes.

(e) Hammers and mallets.

--90--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(f) Drift pins, punches and reamers.
(g) Pliers, wrenches and screwdrivers.
(h) Knives, files and hacksaws.
(i) Anapproved collection system.
4. Therepair shop and the vehicle used to travel to locations where repairs are to be made
must include the following materials:
(a) Lubricants.
(b) Anti-seize compounds.
(c) Sealing compounds.
(d) A quantity of extinguishing agent necessary for servicing or a minimum of 25 pounds of
each agent, as appropriate.
(e) Twenty-five pounds of a specialized agent, including, without limitation, D, K or other
specialized agent.
(f) Fifteen dry chemical discharge nozzles of assorted sizes.
(g) Pressure gaugesin the following sizes:
(1) Twelve 100 psi gauges.
(2) Two 100 psi general vertical gauges.
(3) Two 115 psi gauges.
(4) Six 150 psi gauges.
(5) Four 175 psi gauges.
(6) Eight 195 psi gauges.
(7) Six 240 psi gauges.

(h) Two hundred and fifty assorted “O” rings.

--91--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(i) Twelve assorted valve springs.

()) Thirty assorted valve stems.

(k) Six siphon tubes.

() Thirty safety pull pins.

(m) Four water pressure siphon tubes.

(n) Six water pressure hoses.

(0) Three CO2 rubber handles.

(p) Four CO2 hornsin 10-pound and 15-pound sizes each.

(q) Six 5-pound horns.

(r) Approved service tags and internal tags.

(s) Approved seals.

(t) Eight cartridges of ansul and general types each.

(u) Bracketsand wall hangers.

5. Compliance with the standards of the National Association of Fire Equipment
Distributorsis an acceptabl e alternative to the requirements of this section.

477.443 Exits. Compliance with codes, maximum legal occupancy; windows; ramp or
stairs. (NRS 477.030)

1. Exitsfrom aportable building must meet the requirements of the Uniform Building Code
and Uniform Fire Code.

2. Indetermining the maximum legal occupancy of a classroom for the purpose of exiting,
there must be alowed not less than 20 square feet of net floor space for each person. The
maximum legal occupancy of al other occupancies must be in compliance with table 33-A of the

Uniform Building Code.

--92--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



3. A portable building which has no windows must have at least two exits on opposite walls.

4. A portable building which is being used as a classroom and has a maximum lega
occupancy of 50 or more persons or more than 1,000 square feet in area must have at least two
exits which must be as far from one another as practical.

5. A window which meets the requirements set forth in N.F.P.A. Standard 101, section 11-
2.11.1, may be used in lieu of an exit door if the window is on awall which is opposite an
approved exit door.

6. A portable building used as a classroom or for any purpose relating to education must
have ramps or stairs, or both ramps and stairs:

(&) Which are in compliance with the requirements of the Americans with Disabilities Act of
1990, 42 U.S.C. 88 12101 et seq., or the building code adopted by the State Fire Marshdl,
whichever is more stringent, regarding access to and egress from the building; and

(b) Which are of substantial construction.

477581 “Dangerousfireworks’ defined. “Dangerous fireworks’ means a device which:

1. Contains:

(@) Arsenic sulfide, arsenates or arsenites.

(b) Boron.

(c) Chlorates, exceptin:

(1) A colored mixture of smoke which includes an equal or greater amount of sodium
bicarbonate.

(2) Caps.

(3) A devicewhich contains 4 grams or less of which 15 percent or less of that amount isa

chlorate of potassium, sodium or barium.

--03--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



(d) Gallatesor gallic acid.

(e) Magnesium, except magnesium-aluminum alloys.

(f) Mercury sdts.

(g) Phosphorus, except caps containing red phosphorus.

(h) Picrates or picric acid.

(i) Thiocynates.

(j) Titanium, except in particles which are greater than 100 meshin size.

(k) Zirconium.

2. Explodes and contains more than 50 milligrams (0.772 grains) of explosive.

3. Firesin aeria display.

4. Employsacombustible or explosive material and which risesin the air or darts about the
ground during discharge.

5. Dischargesballs of fire.

6. Explodes through the means of friction.

7. Explodes onimpact.

8. Constitutes an assembly of materials or explosive substances designed by the
manufacturer to be assembled by the person receiving the material or explosive substances and
when assembled comes within the definition of afirework.

9. Isexamined by the State Fire Marshal and determined to possess chemically hazardous
properties similar to those prohibited chemicalslisted in subsection 1 or to have decomposed or
become chemically unstable.

477586 “Firework” defined. “Firework” means a device containing chemical elements

or chemical compounds capable of burning independently of the oxygen of the atmosphere and

--94--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



producing audible, visual, mechanical or thermal effects which are useful as pyrotechnic devices
or for entertainment.

477.685 Containersto betested and listed. (NRS 477.030) Before being offered for sale
in this state, each type of container must be tested and listed by a nationally recognized testing
laboratory as meeting the standard for plastic containers of petroleum ANSI/ASTM D 3435-78
or sections 5202.11.4.5 and 7902.1.8.1.3 of the Uniform Fire Code, or both. A copy of the listing
card must be filed with the State Fire Marshal.

477.760 Standards of construction. (NRS477.030) Type 1 exhaust systems must be
constructed to meet the following requirements:

1. Access doorsto the duct must be located:

(@) Toalow service personnel unrestricted entrance to the access door and duct. The access
doors must not be obstructed by electrical components, mechanical systems or other
impediments to access.

(b) Onthe sides of horizontal ducts, if possible, or on the top when not possible because of
obstructions. Access doors may not be located on the bottom of horizontal ducts.

(c) At every changein direction of the duct.

2. For ductslessthan 24 x 24 inches in size, access openings must be located at intervals not
to exceed 12 feet as measured from the center of one opening to the center of the next opening.

3. For ducts 24 x 24 inchesin size or larger, access openings must be located at intervals not
to exceed 16 feet as measured from the center of one opening to the center of the next opening.

4, Openings for the access door must be as large as the duct allows but are not required to be
larger than 24 x 24 inches. The access openings must leave a1 1/2-inch bottom lip and a 1-inch

top and side lip.

--05--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



5. Access doors must be equipped with:

(@) Tight-fitting doors constructed of steel.

(b) A method of latching sufficient to hold the door tightly closed.

6. Accessdoors must be:

(a) Designed so that they can be opened without the use of atool; and

(b) Located to allow inspection by personnel without the use of any specialized equipment.

7. Access doors must be constructed so that there are no sharp edges which could cause cuts
to service personnel.

8. Inbuildings consisting of Type | and I1-FR construction, the duct and access doors must
be enclosed by 2-hour fire-rated construction.

9. Inbuildings consisting of Type I1-N, 11-1-hour, I11, IV and V construction, the duct and
access doors must be enclosed by 1-hour fire-rated construction. Access doorsin the fire-rated
enclosure must be at least as large as the size of the duct it serves.

477.800 Approval of equipment; compliance with codes, standards and regulations.
(NRS 477.030)

1. Nofire standpipe system or component of such a system may be sold, leased or installed
unless it has been approved, labeled or listed by atesting laboratory approved by the State Fire
Marshal.

2. Fire standpipe systems must comply with the Uniform Fire Code and the National Fire
Codes and Sandards. Any portion of a fire standpipe system which is underground must meet

the requirements of subsection 5 of NAC 477.465.

--96--
LCB Draft of Proposed Regulation R062-04



