APPROVED REGULATION OF THE
STATE FIRE MARSHAL
LCB File No. R183-22

Filed December 29, 2022

EXPLANATION — Matter in italics is new; matter in brackets [emitted-material] is material to be omitted.

AUTHORITY: §§ 1 and 3-8, NRS 477.030 and 477.031; § 2, NRS 432A.180, 477.030 and
477.031.

A REGULATION relating to the State Fire Marshal; setting forth fees for the issuance of a
certificate of compliance by the State Fire Marshal for a child care facility based on zip
codes; increasing certain fees for other certificates of compliance; revising certain
provisions relating to fees charged by the State Fire Marshal; revising various
provisions relating to inspections conducted by the State Fire Marshal; establishing
certain requirements for a request for a variance submitted to the State Fire Marshal;
and providing other matters properly relating thereto.

Legislative Counsel’s Digest:

Existing law requires the State Fire Marshal to adopt a schedule of fees for services and
regulatory activities performed by the State Fire Marshal Division of the Department of Public
Safety which must approximate the cost of those services and activities. (NRS 477.031) Existing
law requires that any child care facility or small child care establishment must be inspected
annually by the State Fire Marshal to secure compliance with standards for safety from fire and
other emergencies. (NRS 432A.180) Existing regulations require that each child care facility
must have a current certificate of compliance issued by the State Fire Marshal or other authority
having jurisdiction, and the State Fire Marshal will assess an annual fee of $22 for such a
certificate of compliance. (NAC 477.325, 477.562) Section 2 of this regulation provides instead
that the State Fire Marshal will assess fees for the issuance of a certificate of compliance for a
child care facility based on the zip code of the child care facility. Section 7 of this regulation
clarifies that each child care facility must: (1) be inspected for compliance with applicable fire
and safety regulations by the State Fire Marshal before a license to operate the facility is issued
and annually thereafter; and (2) have a certificate of compliance issued by the State Fire Marshal.

Existing law requires, with certain exceptions, the State Fire Marshal to assist in checking
plans and specifications for construction. (NRS 477.030) Existing regulations require that all
projects requiring review must receive a certificate of compliance before the building or structure
is occupied. (NAC 477.740) Existing regulations also provide that: (1) the State Fire Marshal
may charge a fee of $38.50 per hour or fraction thereof for inspection services; and (2) the first
inspection will be provided without charge. (NAC 477.325) Section 3 of this regulation
reorganizes certain provisions relating to the fees for an inspection by the State Fire Marshal.

1--
Approved Regulation R183-22



Section 3 further: (1) provides that the State Fire Marshal will charge a fee of $46.20 per hour or
fraction thereof for inspection services; (2) eliminates the provision that allowed the first
inspection to be provided free of charge; and (3) provides that any inspections requiring
overnight travel will include charges for lodging and per diem.

Existing regulations define the term “inspection” as the handling and observation of
certain fire systems and units. (NAC 477.135) Section 4 of this regulation revises the definition
of “inspection” to mean the examination of: (1) the occupancy of buildings, facilities, dwellings
or other structures to determine whether the occupancy complies with the fire and life safety
codes and standards; and (2) a project under construction to determine whether the project
complies with the plans and specifications for construction and the fire and life safety codes and
standards.

Existing regulations provide that the State Fire Marshal may grant a variance from the
requirements of the codes and standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal. (NAC 477.287)
Section 5 of this regulation: (1) requires that a request for a variance be prepared and submitted
by a licensed professional engineer or registered architect in this State; and (2) establishes a fee
for reviewing a request for a variance of $132 per hour or fraction thereof.

Existing regulations establish a fee of $22 for witnessing a test for acceptance. (NAC
477.325) Section 6 of this regulation increases this fee to $27.

Existing regulations set forth certain fees for the review of plans and specifications by the
State Fire Marshal based on the proposed cost of construction or the actual bid for construction.
(NAC 477.750) Section 8 of this regulation increases such fees.

Section 1. Chapter 477 of NAC is hereby amended by adding thereto the provisions set
forth as sections 2 and 3 of this regulation.

Sec. 2. The State Fire Marshal will charge a fee for the issuance of a certificate of
compliance to a child care facility pursuant to NAC 477.562, which includes the fee for the

inspection of the child care facility, on the basis of the zip code of the child care facility. The

fee is as follows:

ZIP CODE FEE

BBIO .vuuvvvenerereessssrssssssssssssssssssssssssssasessssassssssasssssasssssssssssssasessssasssssmssssssasessssasessesn $280.20

88903 .vunvvvueerrrsesssssssssssnsssssmssssssasessssassssssasessssassssssasesssaase s pA AR RR R RR R RR SRR 180.20

BIVOL covvevvvenereresssrrsssssssnsssssmssssssssssssasessssasessssmssssssmsssssssssssssassssssmssssssssesssssssssssssessssess 294.20

B9002.ouvvvenereressssrsssssssnssssssnssssssssessssasessssasssssssssssssmssssssmssssssmsesssssssssssssessssssessssssessssese 180.20

89003 .vunvvveeerrrnessssssssssssnsssssmssssssassssssassssssasssssssssssssmssssssassssssasessssmssssssssesssssssssssssessssess 294.20
o

Approved Regulation R183-22



B0 a..cnaaennnneninnniiinnriinnreissiensariissssisssssisssstisssstessssssssstesssstessssssssssiessssssssssssssssesssssns 237.20
B0V ....cuuanennannnnannnnnnninneniinrnnnnenissnrncsssricssstisssstisssstsssstesssstesssstessssiessssssssssssssssesssssns 237.20
BIOOT eaenaaeeonnneiinnricnnniirerenssiessasisssssisssssisssssessssssssssssssssesssssesssssssssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 294.20
BIOV8 c..cnaaeennnennnniicnnriinerinnnienseerissarisssssiessstisssstisssssssssssesssstesssssssssssessssssssssssssssssssssns 294.20
B9009....cuuuonnnaennnniinnniiineriisriinnniissnrisssstiissstisssstissstsssstssssstssssstsssssiessssessssssastsesssssns 180.20
B RN 294.20
8 I TN 180.20
BIOI2....uuuonnevicnnniiinnrinnriisnsecssasisssasisssssissssssssssssssssssssssesssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
BIOI3cnueonneiiineiiinniinsnrissuninssasisssssisssssisssssesssssssssssssssssesssssssssssssssssesssssssssssssssssesssssns 294.20
BIOT Y acuuuonnneinnnniinnnriinnriisnnnnssusisssssisssssissssssssssssssssssssssesssssesssssssssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
B I TN 180.20
BV B....cuaaennaennnnnnnnnnicnnnnninnnennenissnrncsssnicssssisssssssssssssassessassessssnssssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
L N 294.20
L N 237.20
L N 180.20
B90200.ccccuuonneonninneinninnriiriictinneinstestesstsstesstssss st st ss st s bt s sas s asssas s bt s ss s aaens 237.20
8 N 294.20
89022 ..ottt ssss s st s s st s s s b s sas e a s s aa s b e s bb s baeas 294.20
L N 237.20
89024 cccnuoneenviiniinniieiinincntntncstsstesatsst st ss st a s s s bbb s as s b e st s aaeae 237.20
89025 ettt se s st s a s s s b s sab s b s s as s bt s ba s aeene 237.20
L N 180.20
-3

Approved Regulation R183-22



BO028 ceeeeinnviiieiiiniicntenstiesstiessasisssssisssstesssstssssstsssstesssstssssstesssstessssesasssssastsesssens 294.20
B9029.uuuoiniiiiiiiinninntinstienstiissnsissstissstssssstsssstsssastssssstssssstesssssessssesastsesasasessaasens 294.20
89030 ...cuueonnnennnnniinnriineriisnnninsneissiaricssssicssssisssssissssssssstesssstsssssssssssiessssssssssssssssesssssns 180.20
8903 acnaeennniiinnneiinnninsnnninsnsinssssrsssssicsssssessssssssssssssssssssssesssssssssssssssssessssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
89032 .cueeeiinveiinriiniinsnnesssisssssisssssisssssisssstesssstsssstsssstesssstssssstesssstessssessssssastsesssssns 180.20
BB N 180.20
8903 auneeveonnneiinnriinnninsnninstiissasisssstissssissstssssstsssstsssastssssstssssstesssstessssesasssesasasessassns 294.20
B9036....cnuueennnennnnriinnnriinnreinnninneisssnsisssssisssstissstissstsssstesssstessssssssssiessssessssssasssessassns 180.20
89037 eueeeeevresrenisnnicsnrissnnisssicssssisssssisssssisssssssssstissstsssstesssstssssstesssstesssssessssssssssesssssns 294.20
B90139.neeeiieiiinriinrinntesstinssntisssssissstissstssssstsssstsssastssssstssssstessstesabasesasasesasasessassens 237.20
B0 ...cuuuonnnaonnnnnnnnniicnarinnnnissneisisnrisssstisssstisssstisssstsssstesssstesssstessssiessssssssssssasssssssssns 237.20
B TN 237.20
BOOH2 .ucuuonneenviiniiininriineictintncstsstsssstsstssss st st st s a s s s b s saa s s b s s as s bt s ab s aaeas 294.20
L TN 294.20
L N 180.20
BOOS ettt se st s as s s s b s sa s b s s sas s s b e s sb s aeene 294.20
L N 237.20
L N 294.20
L, N 237.20
L N 294.20
89052 ettt st se s st s a s s s b s sab s bt s as s b e s ab s aaene 180.20
L N 180.20
e

Approved Regulation R183-22



89060 ..unuonneonnennnennneeneennrnnnennneensensnessisstesstssaesssesssessstsssssssassssssssssssassssasssasassees 237.20
890G I ..nnannaonnnennnnennneennnennrnnnnensnnensenssnesssensssesssessssesssessssessssssssssssassssesssssssssssssssssssssses 180.20
89067 canannneennneennennrennrennnennnennneninnensensaesseesstissstsssaesssassssessssssssssssasssssssssssssssssassssessssens 294.20
89070 euuonnueenneennnevneennrineensnrecnenssnenssenssnesssnssssesssesssaesssassssessssssssssssassssesssssssassssassssessssens 237.20
8907 ceuuonneenvennenininniennennnnennenssnesssesssnesssnesssesssnssssssssassssessssssssssssassssssssssssassssassssasassens 180.20
89077 ceuvevneenrensurnnrensnnensaenssnisssensnesssessssssssnssssesssnssssesssassssessssssssssssassssesssssssasssssssssessssees 180.20
BIO8I cuunnaeonneennernnennennnrinnnrennenisnessesssnesssessssesssnssssssssassssessssssssesssassssessssssssssssassssessssses 180.20
8908 cuuennneeneeeninnrinniinninnrentennnessesstesanssstesstssaesssassssessstsssassssasssasssasssasssassssesasaees 180.20
89085 cauueneeenrennirnninnrentensntnnnesntestenstesaessstessstssassssassssessasssssssssassssesssssssassssassssasassees 180.20
89080 ennueonneeennennnennrennninnnenntennnnentensnesaeestessessaesssasssessstsssassssassssssssssssasssassssasassens 180.20
89087 caueenneeinrennernrinsnrennennsnennenssnesssessnesssnssssessssssssssssassssessssssssssssassssssssssssassssssssessssens 180.20
BIIOI cunnnannnennennnennnrennnensnencnenssnenssenssnesssnssssesssessssssssassssessssssssssssassssssssssssassssassssessssses 180.20
BII02..cuuuueonuenveneenennnrcreessnnnensnissenssissaessesssesssissesssessasssessssssssssasssessassasssssstessssssessasssans 180.20
BII03.cuunneonnennnecninrineecreessnnaensnesseessissnsssesssesssissessssssasssesssssssssssessessassasssessasssssssessasssans 180.20
BITO ccueenenneneeneinennercreenennecsnisseesesnissesssesssissesssessasssesssssssssssessessasssasssessasssssssessasssess 180.20
BII0Sccuuonneenveineenennenneicreissenuensiesseessesnissesssesssissessssssasssesssssssssssessessassasssssssessssssessasssans 180.20
BII06..u.euenuonneonnennneneenennennnenrenssenseneissesssesssissessissssssisssssssssssessessassstsssssssessssssessasssans 180.20
BIIO7T couueneenvneecnvisrenrinrnessensnesseesseessessasssesssessssssessssssasssessssssssssasssessasssasssssssssssssessasssans 180.20
BITO8cueeneenveineiniinenneicreinineenenssecssesncssesssesssissesssessasssesssssssesssessessasssessssssssssasssessasssans 180.20
BII09..cuunueonuineineinennercrensnineecnissensiseissessisstissesssissasssissstsstssssessisssssstsssssstssssssssssasssans 180.20
BITI(cuunuenueneonennnennnncrenseneessnissecssessnissesssesssissesssessasssessssssssssasssessasssasssessasssssssessasssass 180.20
BII L1 ..uuunuuonneneenennennencrenssnnnessnnssecssessnsssesssesssessesssessasssesssessssssssssessasssasssessasssssssessasssass 180.20
-5

Approved Regulation R183-22



B I I N 180.20
BOIL T ucnuuonnveicnnniiinnrinennessnsncssssesssasisssssisssssesssssssssssssssssesssssesssssesssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
BOIL LS aunueeinneeiinnnicnnricsnnesssncssssisssssisssssisssssesssssssssssssssssesssssssssssesssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
BOILTB...cnuuenneennnennnneicnnriinnncnnnnissasnsssssesssssisssssssssssssssssesssssessssssssssaessssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
BOLTT uunuevnineviinnicsnnessnnessasncssssnsssssssssssssssssesssssssssssssssssesssssesssssesssssessssssssssssssssssssnssns 180.20
BOIL T8 ueeeeinneiiieiiinnrinnnissuntessasisssssnsssssisssssesssssssssssssssssessssessssssessssiesssssesssssssssssesssssns 180.20
BOIIT9uuueoinneiiinviiinnrinnnissunncssasisssssesssssissssssssssssssssssssssessssssssssssssssssssssesssssssssssesssssns 180.20
BII20..cuuuuunnueicnnniinnnniinerennnnnsnrinisntisssstissstisssstissssssssstesssstsssssnessssiessssesstsssasssesssssns 180.20
3 7 N 180.20
B9I22.cuueeieeiiiniinnninnnnesssicssnsisssssisssstisssstssssstsssstsssastesssstesssstessttessttesastsssastsessassns 180.20
B 7 RN 180.20
B 0 RN 180.20
L N 180.20
L 0 N 180.20
L 0 TN 180.20
L 0 TN 180.20
L N 180.20
L IR TN 180.20
L IR TN 180.20
L IR 7N 180.20
L IR N 180.20
L IR 2 N 180.20
6

Approved Regulation R183-22



BII3 0 uuuennneeneennercrnennennnnennnnennensnnessesssnesssnssssesssnsssaesssassssessstssssssssassssessassssasssassssesassens 180.20
BII37 ceueeeneeirensnnnnnensnnennenssnensesssnesssesstssssnssssessstssssssssasssssssssssssssssassssssssssssassssassssessssens 180.20
3 IR 7. OO PPN 180.20
BII3Yuuuoneeeeennincninnrennennnintistestestesaessssessassaessasssssssassssasssbasssasssaasssassbasssaesanaees 180.20
BIL A uuunnueonneeennennnennennnrennneennenssnesssenssnesssnesssesssessssesssassssessssssssssssassssessssssssssssassssessasees 180.20
BII A cuuunnnennneennennnennennrnensneennnnssnessesssnesssessssesssnssssssssassssessssssssesssassssesssssssasssssssssessssess 180.20
BII A2 euuoneeeneeenercnninnrennenneennessstessessaesaessstessasssaessassssesstsssaessasssasssaasssassbassaesanaees 180.20
BII A3 cuueeneeeirennrrnninnnnennenssnenansssnesssesssnesssnesstesssnssssesssassssesssssssasssassssesssnsssasssassssassssens 180.20
BII A cuuuonueeneeenernninnnennennnentensnessessstesaeesstessesssasssassstesatsssasssassstessaasssassbasstesaaaees 180.20
BIIAS cunuenneenveenircninnrentenneenaesssnessessssessaassstessstssssesssassssessstsssaessassstessssssasssasssesanaees 180.20
BII A0 uuunnueenneennnennrennennnnennennnenssnensenssnesseesssessstssssesssassssessssssssssssassssssssssssassssassssesassees 180.20
BIIAT caueenneeirennrnnninsnnennenssnensnnssnesssessssesssnssssesssnssssssssasssssssssssssssssassssssssssssasssassssasassens 180.20
BITA8 ueoneeveineictiininnicreintenneneissietesnissessessssssesssssassstsas st s see b e e s b e b e b e s b e b s b e b ees 180.20
BITAY.uuoueeiiieiniininnrnrennninnenseisistisnisessesstsssesssssasssesas st s e b s bas b e b e b e s b e b s b e s bees 180.20
BIIS0.cuunuuonueneeneinnennencreenennensnisseesesnissesssesssissesssissassstsssssssssstsssessassstsssssssssassssssaessans 180.20
BIIS1auuunneennenneecnennennnncrenssnneessnisseessessnsssesssesssisseessessasssesssessssssasssessasssasssessssssssssessasssess 180.20
BIIS2ucuuoueeiiiiiiniisninnineessenneseissiesissnsssessesssissessissassstsssssstsssasssessassassaesssssassssssasssase 180.20
BIIB3neeneeriinicniinenninenssinnesiisseesissnsssesstsstisstssissassstsssssstssssessessassassssssssssasssessasssane 180.20
BIISd cueonneeneinvecniinenneicrennineennisiesesasssessesstissesssssassstssssstssaestessas b e aessa s b e b e baesbees 180.20
BIIS5Suuueeneeiiieecnintinninecnsinnesnissiesissaissessesstsssesssssasstssssstssssessessassessaessasbasstsssasssass 180.20
BIIS56.uuunneneeneeneinnenneerenninnennninsecsessecssessessnissessissasssisstsstssstessessassassaessaesasssssasssane 180.20
BII57 oouueereesrenuicnissennissnessinsnesiissessissasssesssssstisssessissassstsssssstsssssssessassasssssssesasssessasssans 180.20
-7--

Approved Regulation R183-22



B9IS59uueiieiiinricntinniensttistttesasissstsssstsssstssssssssasesssstessssses st sesesasesabssesabasesenasens 180.20
BILOG0...cuuuonnuuonnneinnniicnnnniinniinneiissnrisssstissstissstessstsssstesssstesssstsssssiessssesasssssastsessssens 180.20
B /3 N 180.20
BILOB2...cuuuonneiinnniicnnriinnninsnniesnetissnsissstiessstisssstsssstsssastssssstssssstessttesstsesasssesastsesarasans 180.20
B L/ TN 180.20
B /7 TN 180.20
BIL OGS ueeueeionnniiinniiinnnicnnninsntiesneeissnsissstiesstesssstsssstsssastesssstsssstessstessssesasssesasasesasssans 180.20
BILB0.....uuuennaonnnnennneinnnriinnninneniinrisssnissstissstsssstsssastssssstssssstesssssessssesasssesastsessassens 180.20
B9IB9...cuuuonneiinniiiineriinnrinntinnneiesnttssatiesstsssstsssastsssasessssstssssssessssesasssesasasesasasessaasens 180.20
BIL T uecuuueeonnveicnnvvicnnricnnniisunressasisssasisssssisssssesssssesssssssssssesssssesssssssssssesssssssssssssssssssssssns 180.20
BOI 73 uueeeeeicrneicsnricsnncsssncsssissssstsssssssssssssssssssssstsssssssssastesssstssssssesssssesssssessssssasssesssssns 180.20
B9I 77 uveeurressrnncssanissnnssssnesssiessssnsssssisssssisssssssssssssssssssssssesssstssssssesssssessssssssssssssssesssssns 180.20
L I N 180.20
L N 180.20
L N 180.20
L N 180.20
L N 180.20
L L N 180.20
L L TN 180.20
L TN 180.20
L TN 180.20
L N 351.20
8-

Approved Regulation R183-22



B I TN 237.20
B TN 351.20
B I TN 351.20
B TN 237.20
B TN 237.20
B TN 351.20
B TN 351.20
B9L02....cuuuonneiennniiinnriinnniinnnenneiissntissstissstessstsssstsssastssssstessssessssesesssesasssesasasesanssens 180.20
BILO3 anueeennneicneeiinnricnrinstiessneisssssisssssissstssssstsssstsssastssssstssssstesstsessssesastsesastsesssseans 180.20
BN acnaaennnennnniiinnnriinnrinsnnninneiissasisssstissstissstsssstsssastssssstssssstesssstessssesastsssasasesssssens 351.20
BILOS aenneenneiicnnniiinerinenrinsniesteiisinstsssstissstisssstsssstsssastssssstssssstessstessssesasssssasasesassns 294.20
BILDB...cuneennaennnnnnnaiinneniinnninnenisnriisstissstissstsssstsssstesssstssssssesssssessssesasssssasssesssasans 294.20
L TN 237.20
L N 237.20
8940 ottt sttt ss s b s sas s b s sas s b e s ab s aaeas 237.20
L TN 180.20
L 3 TN 180.20
L N 294.20
L R TN 180.20
L TN 237.20
L N 294.20
L N 294.20
-9

Approved Regulation R183-22



B N 237.20
L N 351.20
BOL22ueeieeiiinticntisnntessttessstsssas st s st ss st s ssssssssas e s s st s e s bt s e s bs e seb et e ba s e abasesanasens 294.20
B TN 180.20
8 TN 237.20
B2 ueeieeiicnnicntinnntessttessstsssas st sssst s st ssasssssas e s s st s e s ss e s bt se s b st e ana s e ebasesenasens 351.20
BIL26cuuuenneeennniinnnriinniinnniinaniisastssstesssssssstsssss s st e sssssses st ses st sesasasesasasesanasessaasens 351.20
BT aeeeerierriicsnnicsntissntisssissssstsssstssssssssstsssstssssstsssasessssstes st s e s st sesebasesaba s e ebasessnasens 237.20
B TN 180.20
B9G29 ettt ssssssst s st sssas e s s st s e s s s e s bt se s b s sesaba s e abas e enasens 237.20
B /N 237.20
B TN 237.20
L 7N 237.20
L I TN 237.20
L 2 N 237.20
L 2 N 237.20
L N 237.20
L 3 N 180.20
L 2, N 237.20
L N 237.20
L TN 180.20
L TN 237.20
-10--

Approved Regulation R183-22



B TN 237.20
BOLAS auneeeiereicnricnrcnntessttessttsssastssstsssssssssesssas s s st e sssss s e s st e bs e s b e sesaba s e abasessaasens 351.20
B TN 294.20
B TN 237.20
BOLAE ueeeeereiceiicttinntcnsttcsttssastssssssssssssstsssasssssas e s s st s e s sss e s bt se s b s sesebasesebas e enasene 180.20
B ettt essss st s st s st e s sss s s s ssses bt se s b st e aba s e eba s e saasens 180.20
B /N 180.20
BT L auanneeeonnniiinnriinniinsniensuniensueisssssscssssncssssssssstssssssssassesssssssssssessssiesssssessssssssssssssssees 180.20
B2 ueeiereiiitinntecnntessstessstssas st ss st s st s ss s s ssas e s s st s e s b s e s b s se s b s sesana s e abasesenasens 180.20
BILO0....uueoennuonnnennnniinnnniinnrinnenisnriisstiessstissstsssstsssstssssstesssssessssesasssesastsssasasessassans 180.20
B9 GO....cuuueennaennniinnniiinnriinnninneiinntissstessatsssstsssssss s s sssastes st ses st sesasssesasasesanaseanasene 237.20
BOI501 a...unuaonnnnennnniinnnrinneriinninnaenissnsnsssssicssstissstsssstsssstssssstssssssessssiesssssssssssssssesssssns 237.20
89502 oottt sttt as s b s sas s s s s saa s bt s ab s aa e e 180.20
L N 237.20
L N 237.20
L /TN 237.20
L N 237.20
L N 237.20
L TN 237.20
89509ttt ss s s b s ss s s s s sa s s bt s ab s ae e 180.20
L N 237.20
L 3 N 180.20
11—

Approved Regulation R183-22



B I RN 237.20
B I TN 237.20
L RN 180.20
89520 ucuuuoonneiionnniiinniiinnrinnniinneiisnstssntessstsssstsssstsssasessssstesssssesssssesasssesasssesasasessaasans 237.20
B TN 180.20
89523 ittt sssss s st s st s as s sssas s e s st s e s b s se s bt s e s b et e seba s e abasesenasens 237.20
B TN 237.20
89555 ettt s st s s s s sas e s s st e s s st e s b s e s b et seb e s e abaseenasens 237.20
89557 ettt sssss s st s st s as s sssas e s s st s e s ss s e s bsse s b st aba s e ebasesenasens 237.20
B9 570 uucuuuueonnneiinnaviinnriinnniisnnicnsarisssnsisssssissstisssstessstsssstssssstesssstesssstessssesastsssasssessssns 237.20
89595 ettt st s st s st s as s s s et e e s st s e s ss e s bsse s b et e eba s e ebasesenasens 237.20
89599ttt sssss s sesssas s sssas s s s st e s sss e s bs e s b s seseba s e ba s e anasens 237.20
L N 180.20
L TN 180.20
L TN 180.20
BIT0 cuuenuonneenniinvinninrinriicninntncstesessstsstessssssssst st s st st s b s sab s b s aa s bt s ab s aaeas 180.20
L N 180.20
L N 180.20
L 5 N 180.20
L N 180.20
L R TN 180.20
L TN 180.20
12—

Approved Regulation R183-22



BIBOI annaenneennenneennreinnennrinnnensnrennenssnesssesssnesssesssaesssassssessssssssssssassssessssssssssssassssessssees 237.20
89802 cucunuooneeennienninniinnennrnntentententesaeestessessaessassssessassssassssasssaessaasssassaassssesanases 237.20
89803 cauenneeenrennircninnrentennrnntenstestesstesaessstessessaesssassssessstsssasssasssssssaasssasssasssesasaees 237.20
B98I cuueeneeerreenincnninnrennennrennentesaessaesaesssaessesssaessassssesassssasssasssaessaasssassbassaesanases 237.20
898200 cuucunueeneeeniiinninniintennrnntennentenstesaesstessessaessassssessassssasssassstessaasssaesssassssesanases 237.20
89821 cuuunneeenveenircnninnrnnninnnennensnnensessnessassssessassssesssassssessassssassssassssssssssssassssasssesasaees 180.20
89822 uuuoeeereeniiitinntennennententesaesaesaeessaessessaesssee s esaesssa s b e s ssaessaasssa s sbasssbesaaaees 180.20
89823 cuueeeeitinninntinnieniennentestessessaesaassssessassassssassssesassssaessas st essaasssaesbasssaesanaees 294.20
89824 cuueneeeneieniiitinnnnntinneententesaesaesaesssaessessaessassstesassssaes b e s st s s s s s ssa s b e s saasaaasen 180.20
89825 caueeeeeitenniinninntentennententesaessaesaesssesaassaessasssaesassssasssbas st essaasssa s ba s sbesanasen 351.20
89826 uuucuuueeneeenirinninnninninninntennententesaesstessesssaessassssesssssssasssassstsssaasssaasssasssesanases 351.20
89828 uueoneeenrieninctinnrennennennentesaessaesaessaessessaessassssesaasssasssbas st e s aasssassbasssaesaaasen 237.20
89830 .cuunneonnineiniininneicneininniniinsentinnesesaessssessessasssessesssssee s s sas b e ae s e s b e b s b e b ass 351.20
B98I Lauuuenneineirecrennennrnrensnennennissesssesesssesssesssissessssssasssesssssssssssessissasssasssessssssssssssaessane 294.20
89832 cueiiitiitinnnnninninienintesneeesesassessssst s s sas b s s s st s bbb e s bbb e b e s b e b s b e s b e s 294.20
89833ttt sas st ss s sas b e s s s s s b b s e s bbb e b e s b e b s b e e b e s 237.20
89834 ettt s s b s sss s bbb e s bbb e s b e b s b e e b e s 237.20
89835 ettt ssse s sas s s ss s b e b a s b b e b e s b e b s b e b e s 294.20
BI883 ettt s e b s s s s s b e b s e s b e a s b e s b e b s b e e b e s 351.20

Sec. 3. 1. Except as otherwise provided in this section and section 2 of this regulation,

the State Fire Marshall will charge a fee of $46.20 per hour in relation to any inspection

required to obtain a certificate of compliance pursuant to NAC 477.740.

-13--
Approved Regulation R183-22



2. Except as otherwise provided in section 2 of this regulation, in addition to the fee
required pursuant to subsection 1, the State Fire Marshal will charge the following, if
applicable, in relation to any inspection required to obtain a certificate of compliance
pursuant to NAC 477.740:

(a) If an inspection requires overnight travel by the State Fire Marshal, lodging and per
diem expenses.

(b) If an inspection occurs at a time other than the normal business hours of the State Fire
Marshal, an hourly cost sufficient to cover the salaries and administrative expenses of the
State Fire Marshal.

(c) For a subsequent inspection at the same address, the actual cost of travel, salaries and
administrative expenses.

Sec. 4. NAC 477.135 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.135 H-} “Inspection” means the thandling-and-ebservation} examination of fafixed

1. The occupancy of any building, facility, dwelling or other structure and the uses or
processes associated with such occupancy to determine whether the occupancy complies with

the fire and life safety codes and standards; or

2. Projects for construction to feheekfor-damage to-the systemorunit-which-could
lade it function; lesioned.
—2—The-term-does-notineclude-actual- maintenanee-} determine whether the project complies

with the plans and specifications for construction and the fire and life safety codes and

standards.

--14--
Approved Regulation R183-22



Sec. 5. NAC 477.287 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.287 1. The State Fire Marshal may address, by variance, any requirement of the codes
or standards adopted by him or her. The variance must provide an alternate means and method
for satisfying the requirement that is being addressed by the variance. The State Fire Marshal
will evaluate the alternate means and method used to ensure that the means and method are at
least equivalent with regard to quality, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and
safety as the applicable provisions of NAC and the codes and standards adopted by the State Fire
Marshal.

2. A request for a variance from a requirement of a code or standard adopted by the State
Fire Marshal must:

(a) Be prepared and submitted by a person who is licensed as a professional engineer
pursuant to chapter 625 of NRS or registered as an architect pursuant to chapter 623 of NRS;

(b) Bear the wet stamp and signature of the person who submitted the plans; and

(c) Include not less than two copies of the request for the variance along with the fee
required pursuant to subsection 3.

3. For the review of a request for a variance submitted pursuant to this section, the State
Fire Marshal will charge a fee of 8132 per hour or fraction thereof.

Sec. 6. NAC 477.325 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.325 1. Except as otherwise provided in this chapter, the schedule of fees for:

(a) A license to install or maintain portable fire extinguishers and fixed systems and a

blaster’s certificate of registration is as follows:

(1) Type A for full service of portable fire extinguiShers ............ccccevevieiieniienienieeen. $528
(2) Type B for portable fire extinguishers without hydrostatic service ............ccccevuerueenee. 429
--15--

Approved Regulation R183-22



(3) Type B-C or B-D for Type B with hydrostatic service (C is low pressure,
D is high pressure NYAro) .......o.oveee i 450

(4) Type E for fixed fire extinguishing systems:

(I) E-1 for pre-engineered SYSIEMS .......ccuueeeruiieeriieeiieeeiieeeieeeeieeesieeesereeeereesnaaee e 165
(IT) E-2 for all other engineered SYStEMS .........cccvieruierieeiiieriiieiierie e e eaee e 165
(IIT) Both E-1 and E-2 .....c.ooiiieieeeeee e 330
(5) Type F Or fire @larm ........cccceecvieeiiiiiieiiieiiece ettt 528

(6) Type G for automatic sprinkler systems, except those covered by
N.F.P.A. Standards 13D and 13R, 2016 €dItIONS.......uueeeeieiieeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee e e e et eeeeeeeeeas 528

(7) Type G-U for all underground private fire service mains and their

APPUITETIATICES ..o euvveeeniteeeeteeetteeetteeesteesaeeessteeeassaeeasseeessseeesseeassseeassseeansseeanssessnseessseessseesnsseesns 297
(8) Type G-U for private hydrant repair, installation and maintenance............................ 297
(9) Type G-U for the testing of backflow devices ..........ccceevieeviierieeiiienieeieeie e, 297
(10) Type H for hood and duct Cleaning .............ccoeceerieeiienieeiieenieeieeeeee e 528
(11) Type I for standpipe SYSTEMS .......cecvieiuieeiieriieeiieiie ettt ettt siaeseeeaee e 528

(12) Type J for systems classified pursuant to N.F.P.A. Standards 13D and

T3R, 2016 ©AITIONS .coeeveiieeiiieeee ettt ettt e e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e s sssabaeeeeesesessnaaasseeeesssssnnaneaes 528
(13) A new blaster’s certificate of regiStration...........ccceeeuiereiierieiiiieiieeie e 66
(14) Annual renewal of a blaster’s Certificate ...........ccuvevvuireriiieeciieeciee e 66
(15) Type MG license to install medical gas SyStemS .........ccceeeueeriveriiieniieeiienieeieeeeene. 297

(16) Type EWD (Early Warning Device) license to sell or install heat
EEECTOTS ...ttt a e bttt h et e bt eat e s bt et ea b e sb e et eat e s bt e b e entesbeebe e e 132

(b) A new certificate of registration (€ach Class) ........ccccceerieriiieriiniiiinieeieee e 85

--16--
Approved Regulation R183-22



(c) Renewal of a certificate of re@iStration..........ccceeevveeriieriieiiieeiecie et 40

(d) Issuance of a duplicate license or CertifiCate ...........ccceevierviieriieriieerieeie e 14
(e) Change of information on a certificate Or liCENSe..........cevvveeriieriienieiiieeecieeee e 14
(f) An annual license for the sale at retail of all types of fire extinguishers ..............cccoeue..e. 31
(g) Retaking an examination or any part of an eXamination............ceceevereereeriereererieeneennens 25

(h) A certificate of registration and license for codes and regulations in interior

(1) Renewal of a certificate of registration and license for codes and regulations
TN INEETIOT AESIZI 1.eivtieieiieiieeiie ettt ettt et e et e et e eteeeabeesseeesseesseessseesseessseensaessseesseessseenseensseenns 56

2. The fees for a license do not apply to this State or its political subdivisions. The fees for
certificates of registration apply in all cases. A certificate of registration operates as a license for
a person to perform a specific job for a company licensed pursuant to this chapter and chapter
477 of NRS.

3. The State Fire Marshal will refund the fee for a license, less an administrative fee of
$38.50, if a written request for a refund, stating that the licensee has not, after being licensed,
engaged in any of the activities for which the license is issued, is received by the State Fire
Marshal within 30 days after the date of the issuance of the license.

4. The following fees are established for the administrative and regulatory services of the
State Fire Marshal Division:

(a) All copy service will be at the rate of 50 cents for each page.

(b) Fees for investigative services are as follows:

(1) For expert testimony rendered by the Division in a civil proceeding, the fee of $110 for

each hour of testimony or research will be charged.

—-17--
Approved Regulation R183-22



(2) The actual costs for an investigation must be paid by the person investigated if the
person is found guilty.
(3) Investigative and hearing costs must be paid by the person investigated, if the hearing

officer finds in favor of the State Fire Marshal.

© - : ol : lance s $22 TI :

—+e)} The State Fire Marshal may charge a fee for the following services based on an hourly

cost sufficient to cover the salaries and administrative expenses for:

(1) [Inspections outside ol normal business hours.
—2)} Requests for an immediate review of plans to expedite a project. The State Fire
Marshal will calculate the hourly costs based on the average amount the State Fire Marshal pays
for the position of employment which is applicable to the service being provided, including,
without limitation, inspectors and plan checkers.

3} (2) Additional reviews of plans or specifications required by changes, additions or

alterations to the plans or specifications.

--18--
Approved Regulation R183-22



K4} (3) Reviews of requests to use alternate materials, designs, methods of construction
or equipment.
KD} (d) The fee for witnessing any test for acceptance is {$22} $27 for each test requiring a
separate fee for certification.
K2 (e) A fee may be charged for the costs associated with providing training programs.
The State Fire Marshal may waive this fee if a reasonable justification for doing so is provided.
¥} (P Instructional supplies and materials will be supplied at the approximate cost of
providing them.
9} (2) Fees for instructors are $55.30 per hour, or as set by contract for specific classes,
plus per diem and travel expenses.
91 (h) Any additional costs for service will be added, as well as an administrative fee of 5.5
percent of the total cost of each program.
ot (@) Costs of certification are based upon hours of training, but will not exceed $50. Fees
will be charged for any certification other than:
(1) Initial firefighter certification I and II for a member of a volunteer fire department; or
(2) Certification for hazardous materials awareness and operations for all first responders
for a governmental agency.
KBt () Additional fees equal to those charged for initial testing will be charged for retesting
those who fail.
K} (k) The State Fire Marshal will not collect fees pursuant to this section from a person if
a third party, such as the employer of the person, pays that fee.
ot () Any service provided by the State Fire Marshal Division may be billed at the rate of

$38.50 per hour or the actual cost of providing the service, whichever is greater.

--19--
Approved Regulation R183-22



Koy (m) Any service performed by a special deputy on behalf of the State Fire Marshal may
be billed, pursuant to an interagency agreement, at the rate of $38.50 per hour, the actual cost of
providing the service or any other rate specified by this chapter. The State Fire Marshal may
allow such fees or any part thereof to be collected and used by the agency supporting the special
deputy.

e (n) Approval for equipment or materials which are not on a list published by a
nationally recognized testing laboratory, inspection agency or other organization concerned with
product evaluation will be issued annually for a fee of $610 per product, $38.50 per hour of
research and actual expenses incurred in evaluating the product. If a product or material is not
approved, there will be charged a fee of $38.50 per hour of research and actual expenses incurred
in evaluating the product, except that the minimum fee is $184. Approval of a product lapses if
the:

(1) Product is modified;

(2) Name of the product or person manufacturing the product is changed;
(3) Ownership of the company is changed;

(4) Use of the product is changed; or

(5) Annual fee is not paid.

Kt (o) Requests for statistical information received before the publication of the annual
report will be supplied as available. The administrative cost to receive such statistical
information will be calculated and assessed in accordance with this section.

5. The State Fire Marshal may establish a fee for supplying copies of the annual report to
persons and agencies other than fire, legislative and state agencies. The fee will be limited to the

actual cost of the publication and distribution of the report, plus an administrative fee of $38.50.

--20--
Approved Regulation R183-22



6. The State Fire Marshal may refund all or part of any fee if he or she deems it appropriate.
To be eligible for a training refund, a registrant must give not less than 72 hours’ notice before
removing his or her name from the registration list. The State Fire Marshal may require the
registrant to provide written documentation of the notice.

7. For a plan review, the State Fire Marshal will collect a fee in accordance with section 109
of the International Building Code, 2018 edition.

Sec. 7. NAC 477.562 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.562 1. The following requirements apply to child care facilities that require inspection
and a certificate of compliance to be issued by the fautherity-having jurisdietion:} State Fire
Marshal:

(a) Plans for the construction of new facilities or the remodeling of existing facilities,
including, without limitation, plans to construct or remodel fire systems, must be submitted to
the authority having jurisdiction for approval before the construction or remodeling begins.

(b) Each facility must be inspected for compliance with applicable fire and safety regulations

by the fautherity-havinejurisdietion} State Fire Marshal before a license to operate the facility

is issued. The facility must be inspected annually thereafter and have a current certificate of
compliance issued by the fautherity-havingjurisdietion-} State Fire Marshal.

(c) Smoke alarms, or if they are part of a fire alarm system, smoke detectors, approved by the
State Fire Marshal must be installed pursuant to the manufacturer’s instructions. In newly
constructed buildings, smoke alarms or smoke detectors, as applicable, must receive their
primary power from the building’s wiring, with provision made for the detection of smoke
during a power failure. If a smoke alarm or smoke detector powered by a battery is currently

installed and it fails, the smoke alarm or smoke detector must be replaced by a smoke alarm or

-21--
Approved Regulation R183-22



smoke detector which receives its primary power from the wiring of the building and has a
battery as a backup source of power.

(d) The State Fire Marshal will calculate the maximum number of occupants permitted in:

(1) A child care center based on an occupancy classification of -4 or E.

(2) A child care facility based on an occupancy classification of -4 for children less than 2
1/2 years of age and R-4 for children 2 1/2 years of age or older.

(3) A child care institution based on an occupancy classification of I-4 or E.

(4) A family home based on an occupancy classification of R-3.

(5) A group home based on an occupancy classification of I-4 for children less than 2 1/2
years of age and R-4 for children 2 1/2 years of age or older.

(e) Smoking is prohibited in any area designated as an “E” occupancy area unless the area
has specifically been designated as a smoking area by the authority having jurisdiction. Where
smoking is allowed, ashtrays must be provided.

(f) All stairs must be free of obstacles and stored combustible materials. Handrails with turn-
ins must be provided if there are two or more steps in any stairway.

(g) Bathroom and closet doors must open from the inside without the need for a key or any
special knowledge or effort and must be able to be immediately opened from the outside with the
use of an appropriate device hung or placed above or near the door.

(h) Basements in R-3 occupancies used for child care must have at least two unobstructed
exits which lead directly to the outside, one of which must open directly at ground level.

(i) Portable fire extinguishers must have a minimum rating of 2A-10BC and must be mounted

pursuant to the requirements of:

-20--
Approved Regulation R183-22



(1) N.F.P.A. Standard 10, 2018 edition, and the requirements of the International Fire
Code, 2018 edition; or
(2) The authority having jurisdiction.

(j) Heaters, fireplaces or other similar devices in rooms used for child care must be protected
from contact with children by a sturdy, noncombustible partition, wire screen or protective metal
guard. No portable heating devices are allowed.

(k) All heating equipment and hot water heaters must be:

(1) Enclosed in a manner which prevents children from coming into contact with them;
and
(2) Secured as required by the codes and standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal.

() Child-resistant covers must be installed on all electrical outlets accessible to children.

(m) Wastebaskets, garbage cans and other containers used to store garbage, waste, rubbish
and other combustible materials must be constructed of noncombustible materials and have a
tight-fitting lid of the same material. Wastebaskets or other trash containers placed in the
designated smoking areas must be constructed of noncombustible materials with a tight-fitting
lid of the same material.

(n) No more than 10 gallons of flammable liquid may be stored in any area designated as an
“E” area. This flammable liquid must be stored in an approved metal container and out of the
reach of children.

(o) Rooms in which equipment is used or where flammable liquids, combustible dust or
similar hazardous materials are handled must be separated from other portions of the building by
a material which has a rating of at least 1-hour fire barrier and must conform to the requirements

of the International Building Code, 2018 edition.

-23--
Approved Regulation R183-22



2. Asused in this section:

(a) “Child care center” has the meaning ascribed to it in NAC 432A.050.

(b) “Child care facility” has the meaning ascribed to it in NAC 432A.060.

(c) “Child care institution” has the meaning ascribed to it in NAC 432A.070.

(d) “Family home” has the meaning ascribed to it in NAC 432A.100.

(e) “Group home” has the meaning ascribed to it in NAC 432A.110.

Sec. 8. NAC 477.750 is hereby amended to read as follows:

477.750 1. Any plans and specifications submitted to the State Fire Marshal for review
must be accompanied by the appropriate fee based upon the proposed cost of construction or if a

bid is accepted, the actual bid, according to the following:

Valuation Fee Valuation Fee
$1-4,000........... 173151 $87.78 13,001-14,000......... H42231 170.68
4,001-5,000............... 178981 94.78 14,001-15,000......... H4927 179.12
5,001-6,000............. 186:02} 103.22 15,001-16,000......... H56:201 187.44
6,001-7,000............. 193-66} 111.67 16,001-17,000......... H6324} 195.89
7,001-8,000........... Ho00-106} 120.12 17,001-18,000......... H76281 204.34
8,001-9,000........... po7141 128.57 18,001-19,000......... H76:221 211.46
9,001-10,000......... BH4431 136.96 19,001-20,000......... H8436} 221.23
10,001-11,000......... P24 145.33 20,001-21,000......... H91+-461 229.68
11,001-12,000......... H28451 153.78 21,001-22,000......... 9844} 238.13
12,001-13,000......... H3549} 162.23 22,001-23,000......... {26537 246.44
24

Approved Regulation R183-22



Valuation Fee

23,001-24,000......... 2124+ 254.89
24,001-25,000......... 219451 263.34
25,001-26,000......... 22454 269.41
26,001-27,000......... 22957 275.48
27,001-28,000......... 234521 281.42
28,001-29,000......... 239581 287.50
29,001-30,000......... 243-981 292.78
30,001-31,000......... 2497061 299.64
31,001-32,000......... 254-651 305.58
32,001-33,000......... 2397+ 311.65
33,001-34,000......... 26474 317.72
34,001-35,000......... 269831 323.80
35,001-36,000......... P74781 329.74
36,001-37,000......... 279841 335.81
37,001-38,000......... 284901 341.88
38,001-39,000......... 289961 347.95
39,001-40,000......... 29494 353.89
40,001-41,000......... 29997 359.96
41,001-42,000......... 305-031 366.04
42,001-43,000......... B16:09 372.11

43,001-44,000......... B304 378.05

-25--

Valuation Fee

44,001-45,000......... 32610} 384.12
45,001-46,000......... B25-+61 390.19
46,001-47,000......... 336221 396.26
47,001-48,000......... B35+H 402.20
48,001-49,000......... 346231 404.28
49,001-50,000......... 345291 414.35
50,001-51,000......... 3488+ 418.57
51,001-52,000......... 352331 422.80
52,001-53,000......... B355851 427.02
53,001-54,000......... B3937H 431.24
54,001-55,000......... B62-78} 435.34
55,001-56,000......... 366301 439.56
56,001-57,000......... 369821 443.78
57,001-58,000......... B73341 448.01
58,001-59,000......... B76-861 452.23
59,001-60,000......... 38038} 456.46
60,001-61,000......... 383901 460.68
61,001-62,000......... B87421 464.90
62,001-63,000......... 390941 469.13
63,001-64,000......... 394461 473.35

64,001-65,000......... B97981 477.58

Approved Regulation R183-22



Valuation Fee

65,001-66,000......... {40150} 481.80
66,001-67,000......... {40491 485.89
67,001-68,000......... 1408431 490.12
68,001-69,000......... 4951 494.34
69,001-70,000......... 41547 498.56
70,001-71,000......... 42254 507.01
71,001-72,000......... {426:031 511.24
72,001-73,000......... 1429551 515.46
73,001-74,000......... 1433674 519.68
74,001-75,000......... 436591 523.91
75,001-76,000......... {44011+ 528.13
76,001-77,000......... {443-631 532.36
77,001-78,000......... 447151 536.58
78,001-79,000......... 456561 540.67
79,001-80,000......... 457601 549.12
80,001-81,000......... H4ett2] 553.34
81,001-82,000......... 1466841 560.21
82,001-83,000......... {46816} 561.79
83,001-84,000......... 47681 566.02
84,001-85,000......... 475201 570.24

85,001-86,000......... H7r872} 574.46

-26--

Valuation Fee

86,001-87,000......... 482241 578.69
87,001-88,000......... 485761 582.91
88,001-89,000......... 1489281 587.14
89,001-90,000......... {492-801 591.36
90,001-91,000......... {4962 595.45
91,001-92,000......... 1499731 599.68
92,001-93,000......... 563251 603.90
93,001-94,000......... 50674 608.12
94,001-95,000......... $10:291 612.35
95,001-96,000......... B38H 616.57
96,001-97,000......... B1+7331 620.80
97,001-98,000......... 526851 625.02
98,001-99,000......... B2437 629.24

99,001-100,000....... B27891 633.47

Approved Regulation R183-22



2. If'the proposed cost or bid is more than $100,000 but less than $500,000, the fee is
1853144+ $633.47 for the first $100,000 plus $2-:69} $3.22 for each additional $1,000 or fraction
thereof of the proposed cost or bid.

3. Ifthe proposed cost or bid is $500,000 or more but less than $1,000,000, the fee is
18166944 $1,931 for the first $500,000 plus {$2-37} $2.84 for each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof of the proposed cost or bid.

4. If the proposed cost or bid is $1,000,000 or more, the fee is {$2,780-9H $3,337.10 for the
first $1,000,000 plus $1.65 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof of the proposed cost or
bid.

5. [Ifaconference is required for any given project, a fee will be charged at the rate of {$55}
866 per hour or any fraction thereof, for each person from the State Fire Marshal’s Office
required to attend the conference.

6. If an agreement is reached by a local government and the State Fire Marshal whereby the
process for review of the plans is delegated to the local authority, the local authority may use the
schedule of fees set forth in this section or a schedule of fees which has been approved by the
local authority.

7. If areview of plans by a local government waives or grants a variance of a minimum
standard established by the State Fire Marshal or otherwise requires review by the State Fire
Marshal, the local government shall require the plans to be submitted to the State Fire Marshal
for review. The State Fire Marshal will charge the person on whose behalf the plans are

submitted a fee of {$55} $66 per hour for each person who participates in the review. The State

-27--
Approved Regulation R183-22



Fire Marshal will notify the local government of his or her approval or disapproval of the plans

upon completion of his or her review.

-28--
Approved Regulation R183-22



